



Award Notice

FY2026 Term Contract:	750-26-0 Fuel and Oil
Awarded To:	1. <u>Arguindegui Oil CO. II Ltd</u> • Primary 2-1, 2-2, 2-5 • Secondary 1-2, 2-4, 2-6, 2-7 • Third 1-1 2. <u>Hollon Oil Company</u> • Primary 2-3, 2-6, 2-7 • Secondary 2-5 • Third 2-4 3. <u>Pico Propane & Fuels</u> • Primary 1-1, 1-2 4. <u>Pinnacle Petroleum, Inc.</u> • <u>Secondary 1-1</u> • <u>Third 1-2</u> 5. <u>Safety Kleen Systems, Inc.</u> • Primary 2-4
Term:	One Year/Two (One-year) option to renew
Term Period:	February 2026 – December 2026

Mission Consolidated Independent School District
Tabulation Form
Fuel and Oil #750-26-0

					Arguindegui Oil Co. II, Ltd		Gold Star Petroleum, Inc.		Hollon Oil Company		Petroleum Traders Corporation	
					Vendor #2504		Vendor # 4639		Vendor #71476		Vendor #5816	
					Beto Lopez		Celena Spiegelhauer		Daniel Cortez		Joseph Vanderpool	
					956-722-5251		281-379-5928		956-207-1392		888-637-7661	
					beto.lopez@argpetro.com		goldstarpetro@comcast.net		dcortez@hollonoil.com		jvanderpool@petroleumtraders.com	
#	Items	Detail	UOM	Quantity Required	Quoted Price	Notes	Quoted Price	Notes	Quoted Price	Notes	Quoted Price	Notes
1												
#1-1	Regular Unleaded Gasoline – Must be supplied by a refiner listed in the OPIS report. Minimum 87 octane, NO OXINATED AND/OR ALCOHOL BASED COMPOUND MAY BE ADDED. Detergent additives MUST be added.	Cents per gross gallon over base price	Gallon	1	\$0.0100	Price over OPIS Average	\$0.0250	Tankwagon: Unleaded & Diesel OPIS Daily Avg@ Edinburg + .0250\$/gallon. Transport: 7500 gallon minimum - can be mix of unleaded and diesel. Unleaded & Diesel: OPIS Daily Avg + .0100\$/gallon	No Bid		No Bid	
#1-2	Ultra-Low Sulfur Diesel (On-Road) – 15 PPM level, #2 grade, 48 Cetage/FG X API regional specs. An additive for low sulfur diesel fuel, necessary for lubrication, MUST be added. Diesel may be up to 5% biodiesel / 95% petro diesel blend. NO OXINATED AND/OR ALCOHOL BASE COMPOUND MAY BE ADDED. Diesel Additive MUST BE ADDED.	Cents per gross gallon over base price	Gallon	1	\$0.0050	Price over OPIS Average	\$0.0250	Tankwagon: Unleaded & Diesel OPIS Daily Avg@ Edinburg + .0250\$/gallon. Transport: 7500 gallon minimum - can be mix of unleaded and diesel. Unleaded & Diesel: OPIS Daily Avg + .0100\$/gallon	No Bid		\$0.0240	Petroleum Traders will provide 40 cetane diesel. OPIS/Harlingen/Daily/Contract Average. Pricing listed is based on full load of 7,500 diesel fuel.
2												
#2-1	Gear oil, SAE 85W-140 omit (140) add 90 Synthetic, Specs: Rear axle MIL-PRF 2105E API MT-1 GL-5.	Price per 25 pound drum	25 Pound Drum	1	\$73.27	AOC Prem UGL 85w140 Pall	No Bid		\$114.16	35 lbs. syn 75w90	No Bid	
#2-2	Motor oil, SAE 5W-30, Pennzoil Synthetic or District-approved equivalent.	Price per 55 pound drum	55 Pound Drum	1	\$966.87	KD GT-1 Max MO 5W30	No Bid		\$479.50	Service Pro	No Bid	
#2-3	Motor oil, SAE 10W-40, Chevron-Delo 400+ or District-approved equivalent.	Price per 55 pound drum	55 Pound Drum	1	No Bid		No Bid		\$1,028.25	Chevron-Delo 400	No Bid	
#2-4	Motor oil, SAE 15W-40, Goldstar Fleetguard Premium Synthetic or District-approved equivalent.	Price per 55 pound drum	55 Pound Drum	1	\$512.60	AOC Prem HDEO 15w40 CK-4	No Bid		\$579.85	Purus Brand	No Bid	
#2-5	Motor oil, SAE 5W-30, Pennzoil or District-approved equivalent.	Price per 55 gallons a month	55 Pound Drum	1	\$432.67	AOC Prem SB 5w30	No Bid		\$479.50	Service Pro	No Bid	
#2-6	Premium diesel engine oil API Service Category CK-4	Price per gallon delivered in bulk, 150 gallons or more per order	Gallon	1	\$9.23	AOC Prem HDEO 15w40 CK-4	No Bid		\$8.88	Purus Brand	No Bid	
#2-7	Diesel exhaust fluid, Air1 Brand or District-approved equivalent	Price per gallon delivered in bulk, 250 gallons per month	Gallon	1	\$1.77	DEF	No Bid		\$1.76	Peak/Blue DEF	No Bid	
					Pico Propane & Fuels		Pinnacle Petroleum, Inc.		Safety Kleen Systems, Inc.		Sun Coast Resources, LLC	
					Vendor #106006		Vendor #		Vendor #71616		Vendor #	
					Jim Elliff		Liz McKinley		Leonard Lapham		Tina Hardy	
					956-802-3572		714-841-8877		781-427-3060		713-429-6702	
					jelliff@pico propane.com		lmckinley@pinnaclepetroleum.com		lapham.leonard@safety-keen.com		contractpricing@suncoastresources.com	
#	Items	Detail	UOM	Quantity Required	Quoted Price	Notes	Quoted Price	Notes	Quoted Price	Notes	Quoted Price	Notes
1												
#1-1	Regular Unleaded Gasoline – Must be supplied by a refiner listed in the OPIS report. Minimum 87 octane, NO OXINATED AND/OR ALCOHOL BASED COMPOUND MAY BE ADDED. Detergent additives MUST be added.	Cents per gross gallon over base price	Gallon	1	\$0.0000	Margins above OPIS Harlingen average would be 0, zero. Fuel would be delivered at posted average rack flat.	\$0.0084	Best available Rack Price on the day of delivery, plus \$0.0084	No Bid		\$0.0199	Gross OPIS Daily Average - Harlingen, TX. Pricing is based on 3000+ gallon deliveries.
#1-2	Ultra-Low Sulfur Diesel (On-Road) – 15 PPM level, #2 grade, 48 Cetage/FG X API regional specs. An additive for low sulfur diesel fuel, necessary for lubrication, MUST be added. Diesel may be up to 5% biodiesel / 95% petro diesel blend. NO OXINATED AND/OR ALCOHOL BASE COMPOUND MAY BE ADDED. Diesel Additive MUST BE ADDED.	Cents per gross gallon over base price	Gallon	1	\$0.0000	Margins above OPIS Harlingen average would be 0, zero. Fuel would be delivered at posted average rack flat.	\$0.0054	Winterized Diesel. Best available Rack Price on the day of delivery, plus \$0.0054	No Bid		\$0.0199	Gross OPIS Daily Average - Harlingen, TX. Pricing is based on 3000+ gallon deliveries.
2												
#2-1	Gear oil, SAE 85W-140 omit (140) add 90 Synthetic, Specs: Rear axle MIL-PRF 2105E API MT-1 GL-5.	Price per 25 pound drum	25 Pound Drum	1	No Bid		No Bid		\$699.00	Gear Oil GL-5 80W-90 \$699.00. Gear Oil GL-5 85W-140 \$775.00.	No Bid	
#2-2	Motor oil, SAE 5W-30, Pennzoil Synthetic or District-approved equivalent.	Price per 55 pound drum	55 Pound Drum	1	No Bid		No Bid		\$6.10	PCEO SP/GF-7A 5W-30 SYN BLEND	No Bid	
#2-3	Motor oil, SAE 10W-40, Chevron-Delo 400+ or District-approved equivalent.	Price per 55 pound drum	55 Pound Drum	1	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
#2-4	Motor oil, SAE 15W-40, Goldstar Fleetguard Premium Synthetic or District-approved equivalent.	Price per 55 pound drum	55 Pound Drum	1	No Bid		No Bid		\$455.00	Diesel Engine Oil HDDEO CK-4/SN 15W-40	No Bid	
#2-5	Motor oil, SAE 5W-30, Pennzoil or District-approved equivalent.	Price per 55 gallons a month	55 Pound Drum	1	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
#2-6	API Service Category CK-4 Oils	Price per gallon delivered in bulk, 150 gallons or more per order	Gallon	1	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
#2-7	Diesel exhaust fluid, Air1 Brand or District-approved equivalent	Price per gallon delivered in bulk, 250 gallons per month	Gallon	1	No Bid		No Bid		\$1,365.00	Performance Plus DEF	No Bid	

Triton Trading Inc - Please see attachment for pricing.

Evaluation Committee:

Ana Vely Uresti - Transportation Director
Isidoro Reyna - Transportation Asst. Coordinator
Jorge Ochoa - Transportation Shop Foreman

Notes:

Gold Star Petroleum, Inc - Invoices will include separate line items for the LUST (.001\$/gallon) and the TPPDF - See schedule.
Petroleum Traders - Prices exclude all applicable taxes and fees, which will be billed as a separate line item on each invoice.

Line Item Legend:

Green - Primary Vendor
Yellow - Secondary Vendor
Orange - Third Vendor

Board Workshop - February 4, 2026
Board Meeting - February 11, 2026



TRITON TRADING INC.
2501 Parkview Drive Ste 316,
Fort Worth, Texas 76102

GASOLINE: STATE TAX & FEDERAL FEES NOT APPLICABLE

Line-Item No. 1		UNIT PRICE
A. UNLEADED REGULAR GASOLINE	OPIS PRICE	\$ 1.8464
B. COMMISSION PRICE		\$ 0.1950
C. COST FOR TRANSPORT DELIVERY		\$ 750.00
D. COST FOR BOBTAIL DELIVERY		\$ 600.00
E. TOTAL LOAD PRICE BETWEEN 4,000 to 9,000 GALLONS		\$ 1.9569
F. TOTAL LOAD PRICE FOR LESS THAN 4,000 GALLONS		\$ 2.0159

DIESEL: STATE TAX & FEDERAL FEES NOT APPLICABLE

Line-Item No. 2		UNIT PRICE
A. #2 ULTRA LOW SULFUR DIESEL	OPIS PRICE	\$ 2.3483
B. COMMISSION PRICE		\$ 0.0495
C. COST FOR TRANSPORT DELIVERY		\$ 750.00
D. COST FOR BOBTAIL DELIVERY		\$ 600.00
E. TOTAL LOAD PRICE BETWEEN 4,000 to 9,000 GALLONS		\$ 2.5019
F. TOTAL LOAD PRICE FOR LESS THAN 4,000 GALLONS		\$ 2.5478

Line-Item No. 3		UNIT PRICE
A. #2 ULTRA LOW SULFUR DYED DIESEL FUEL	OPIS PRICE	\$ 2.3362
B. COMMISSION PRICE		\$ 0.0495
C. COST FOR TRANSPORT DELIVERY		\$ 750.00
D. COST FOR BOBTAIL DELIVERY		\$ 600.00
E. TOTAL LOAD PRICE BETWEEN 4,000 to 9,000 GALLONS		\$ 2.4898
F. TOTAL LOAD PRICE FOR LESS THAN 4,000 GALLONS		\$ 2.5357



750-26-0 - Fuel and Oil Scoring Summary

Active Submissions

	Total	Price	Reputation of Vendor and of Vendor's goods and/or services	Quality of Vendor's goods and/or services	The extent to which the goods and/or services meet the Mission CSD's needs	Vendor's past relationship with Mission CSD
Supplier	/ 100 pts	/ 35 pts	/ 25 pts	/ 15 pts	/ 20 pts	/ 5 pts
Pico Propane & Fuels	100	35	25	15	20	5
Arguindegui Oil Co. II, Ltd	92	33	23	13	18	5
Pinnacle Petroleum, Inc.	88	33	20	14	19	2
Hollon Oil Company	88	31	22	12	17	5
Safety-Kleen Systems, Inc.	88	30	21	13	19	5
Sun Coast Resources, LLC	78	29	20	11	16	2
Triton Trading Inc.	75	21	20	14	17	3
Gold Star Petroleum, Inc.	73	22	19	13	16	3
Petroleum Traders Corporation	72	23	18	12	16	3

Evaluation Committee

Ana Vely Uresti - Transportation Director

Isidoro Reyna - Transportation Asst. Coordinator

Jorge Ochoa - Transportation Shop Foreman