



# Mission C.I.S.D.

1201 Bryce Drive,  
Mission, TX 78572  
P: (956) 323-5500

FY2025 Term Contract:	Fuel and Oil #750-25-0
Awarded To:	<ol style="list-style-type: none"> <li><u>Arguindegui Oil Co. II, Ltd</u> <ul style="list-style-type: none"> <li>Secondary 2-1, 2-6</li> <li>Third 1-1, 2-5</li> <li>Forth 1-2, 2-4</li> <li>Fifth 2-2, 2-7</li> </ul> </li> <li><u>Hollon Oil Company</u> <ul style="list-style-type: none"> <li>Primary 2-2, 2-4, 2-5, 2-6, 2-7</li> <li>Secondary 2-3</li> <li>Third 2-1</li> </ul> </li> <li><u>Oil Patch Fuel and Supply</u> <ul style="list-style-type: none"> <li>Secondary 1-1, 1-2, 2-7</li> <li>Third 2-2, 2-6</li> <li>Forth 2-5</li> <li>Fifth 2-4</li> </ul> </li> <li><u>Pico Propane &amp; Fuels</u> <ul style="list-style-type: none"> <li>Primary 1-1, 1-2, 2-1</li> <li>Forth 2-6, 2-7</li> </ul> </li> <li><u>Safety-Kleen Systems, Inc</u> <ul style="list-style-type: none"> <li>Secondary 2-2, 2-4, 2-5</li> <li>Fifth 2-1</li> <li>Sixth 2-7</li> </ul> </li> <li><u>Sunoco LP</u> <ul style="list-style-type: none"> <li>Third 1-2</li> <li>Forth 1-1</li> </ul> </li> </ol>
Term:	One Year
Term Period:	January 2025 – December 2025

Mission Consolidated Independent School District  
Tabulation Form  
Fuel and Oil #750-25-0

					Arguindegui Oil Co. II, Ltd		HOLLON OIL COMPANY		OIL PATCH FUEL AND SUPPLY		Pico Propane & Fuels		Safety Kleen Systems, Inc.		Sunoco LP	
					Vendor #2504		Vendor #71476		Vendor #2400		Vendor #106006		Vendor #71616		Vendor #	
					Beto Lopez		Daniel Arriaga		Gloria Grez		Jim Elliff		Leonard Lapham		Jessica Gonzalez	
					956-722-5251		956-975-0168		956-781-9047		956-802-3572		781-427-3060		260-324-7926	
Selected #					beto.lopez@argpetro.com		darriaga@hollonoil.com		gloria@oilpatchfuelandsupply.com		jelliff@picopropane.com		lapham.leonard@safety-keen.com		bidresearch@gladieuxenergy.com	
					8		7		8		5		5		2	
#	Items	Detail	UOM	Quantity Required	Quoted Price	Notes	Quoted Price	Notes	Quoted Price	Notes	Quoted Price	Notes	Quoted Price	Notes	Quoted Price	Notes
#1-1	Diesel fuel, (ULSD) ultra-low sulfur diesel with 15 PPM level, #2 grade, 48 Cetane/FG X API regional specs. An additive for low sulfur diesel fuel, necessary for lubrication, MUST be added. Diesel may be up to 5% biodiesel / 95% petro diesel blend. NO OXINATED AND/OR ALCOHOL BASE COMPOUND MAY BE ADDED Diesel Additive MUST BE ADDED	Cents per gross gallon over base price	Gallon	1	0.0199	Price over OPIS Average	No Bid	No Bid	0.0150	OPIS AVG +.0150	0.0090	Opis Average	No Bid	No Bid	0.0325	Price over OPIS
#1-2	Regular unleaded gasoline, supplied by a refiner listed in OPIS report. Minimum 87 octane, NO OXINATED AND/O ALCOHOL BASE COMPOUND MAY BE ADDED. Detergent additives MUST be added.	Cents per gross gallon over base price	Gallon	1	0.0399	Price over OPIS Average	No Bid	No Bid	0.0200	OPIS AVG +.022	0.0190	N/A	No Bid	No Bid	0.0325	Price over OPIS
#2-1	Gear oil, SAE 85W-140 omit (140) add 90 Synthetic, Specs: Rear axle MIL-PRF 2105E API MT-1 GL-5	Price per 25 pound drum	25 Pound Drum	1	\$ 90.86	AOC Prem UGL 85w140	\$ 114.16	35 lbs.Syn 75W90	\$ 733.59	SHELL SYN.OIL	\$ 63.70	N/A	\$ 957.76	Performance Plus Part # 3101776	No Bid	No Bid
#2-2	Motor oil, SAE 5W-30, Pennzoil Synthetic or District approved equal.	Price per 55 pound drum	55 Pound Drum	1	\$ 1,053.40	P66 MP GL 85w140	\$ 479.50	SERVICE PRO	\$ 693.55	QS SYN	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 651.60	Performance Plus Part # 3103323	No Bid	No Bid
#2-3	Motor oil, SAE 10W-40, Chevron-Delo 400+ or District approved equal	Price per 55 pound drum	55 Pound Drum	1	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 1,028.25	Chevron-Delo 400	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
#2-4	Motor oil, SAE 15W-40, Goldstar Fleetguard Premium Synthetic or District approved equal	Price per 55 pound drum	55 Pound Drum	1	\$ 723.64	AOC Prem HDEO 15w40 CK-4	\$ 579.85	PURUS BRAND	\$ 770.55	ROTELLA SYN BLD	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 629.26	Performance Plus Part # 3102256	No Bid	No Bid
#2-5	Motor oil, SAE 5W-30, Pennzoil or District approved equal	Price per 55 gallons a month	55 Pound Drum	1	\$ 572.00	AOC Prem Syn Blend 5w30 SN GF-6A	\$ 479.50	SERVICE PRO	\$ 583.55	QS SYN BLD	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 540.61	Performance Plus Part # 3103306	No Bid	No Bid
#2-6	Premium diesel engine oil, API CJ-4 Plus, CI-4, & CH-4 approved, OEM approvals; A) CAT ECF-3, B) CAT ECF-1, C) Detroit Diesel 93K218 Low ash oil, product covered by warranty and purchased through an authorized shell distributor, international OEM approved supplier, John Deere, JI case, Mack, EOL, Caterpillar, Cummins, and Cummins NTC 400 & 2x 400 & L-10, Navistar. Should contain a frictional modifier. Successful bidder must supply District, at no cost, 1 bulk tank (250 gallon minimum). 1 air operated pump and 1 metering dispenser. If supplied in 55 gallon drum, successful bidder must supply District, at no cost 1 air operated pump and 1 metering dispenser	Price per gallon delivered in bulk, 150 gallons or more per order	Gallon	1	\$ 11.73	AOC Prem HDEO 15w40 CK-4	\$ 8.88	PURUS BRAND	\$ 12.41	PRICE PER GAL	\$ 12.49		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
#2-7	Diesel exhaust fluid Air1 Brand or District approved equal	Price per gallon delivered in bulk, 250 gallons per month	Gallon	1	\$ 2.28	DEF	\$ 1.76	PEAK/BLUEDEF	\$ 1.99	PRICE PER GAL	\$ 2.27	November price	\$ 3.00	Performance Plus Part # 321001	No Bid	No Bid