



Award Notice

Revised 2/12/2026

FY2027 Term Contract:	345-26-1 E-Rate 29 Internet Access and Internal Connections
Awarded To:	1. <u>Foremost Communications</u> • Internet Access 2. <u>Netsync Network Solutions</u> • Internet Access Equipment • Networking Cabling • Network Infrastructure Hardware • Uninterruptible Power Supply 3. <u>Sequel Data Systems, Inc.</u> • Wireless Hardware
Term:	One Year/Two (One-year) option to renew
Term Period:	July 2026 – June 2027

Mission Consolidated Independent School District
 Tabulation Form
 E-Rate Round 29 Internet Access and Internal Connections - RFP# 345-26-1

E-Rate29 FY2026				
	Internet Access	Foremost	Smartcom	Ahead in The Cloud
4.4.1	Internet Access			
	Internet Service Provider 10GB (Mission CISD)	\$ 23,940.00	\$ 23,988.00	\$ 24,478.07

	Internet Access Equipment	Netsync	Sequel Data	Ahead in The Cloud	Converged Networks	Anet Partners
4.4.2	Internet Access Category 1 Equipment	\$ 144,964.74	\$ 40,569.75	\$ 40,388.67	\$ 23,744.50	INCOMPLETE BID

	Internal Connections	Netsync	Sequel Data	Ahead in The Cloud	Converged Networks	Anet Partners
4.4.3	Networking Cabling	\$ 17,002.27	NO BID	\$ 22,103.80	NO BID	INCOMPLETE BID
4.4.4	Network Infrastructure Hardware	\$ 995,203.51	\$ 912,329.25	\$ 1,013,248.88	\$ 649,193.00	INCOMPLETE BID
4.4.5	Wireless Hardware	\$ 970,431.41	\$ 629,597.71	\$ 967,203.22	\$ 884,890.00	INCOMPLETE BID
4.4.6	Uninterruptible Power Supply	\$ 63,878.10	NO BID	\$ 30,184.50	\$ 19,160.00	INCOMPLETE BID

Internet Access	\$ 23,940.00
Internet Access Equipment	\$ 144,964.74
Category One Total	\$ 168,904.74

Networking Cabling	\$ 17,002.27
Network Infrastructure Hardware	\$ 995,203.51
Wireless Hardware	\$ 629,597.71
Uninterruptible Power Supply	\$ 63,878.10
Category Two Total	\$ 1,705,681.59

CATEGORY ONE AND TWO PROJECT TOTAL	\$ 1,874,586.33
Legend	
Recommended Vendors	3
Incomplete Proposals	1
Project Grand Total	\$ 1,874,586.33
E-Rate Eligible Projects	\$ 1,863,324.26

SLD Estimated Budget/Discount	1,592,002.91
MCISD Estimated Cost	\$ 282,583.42
Total Cost to MCISD	\$ 282,583.42

10% For additional unexpected costs	\$ 28,258.34
	\$ 310,841.76

Mission Consolidated Independent School District
 Bid Evaluation
 E-Rate Round 29 Internet Access and Internal Connections - RFP# 345-26-1

Criteria		Weight
1	Price	35
2	Reputation of Vendor and of Vendor's goods and/or services	5
3	Quality of Vendor's goods and/or services	10
4	Extent to which the goods and/or services meet Mission CISD's needs	30
5	Vendor's past relationship with Mission CISD	5
6	Ability to comply with federal program rules	5
7	Total long-term cost to Mission CISD to acquire Vendor's goods and/or services	10
8	For a contract for goods and services, other than goods and services related to telecommunications and information services, building construction and maintenance, or instructional materials, whether the Vendor or the Vendor's ultimate parent company or majority owner: (A) has its principal place of business in this state; or (B) employs at least 500 persons in this state	0
9	Other	0
Total		100

4.4.1 Internet Access			
	Foremost	Smartcom	Ahead in the Cloud
1	35	34	34
2	5	5	5
3	10	10	10
4	30	30	10
5	5	5	0
6	5	5	5
7	10	10	10
8	0	0	0
9	0	0	0
	100	99	74

4.4.2 Internet Access Equipment					
	Netsync	Sequel Data	Ahead in The Cloud	Converged Networks	Anet Partners
1	5	20	20	35	INCOMPLETE BID
2	5	5	5	5	INCOMPLETE BID
3	10	10	10	10	INCOMPLETE BID
4	30	0	0	0	INCOMPLETE BID
5	5	5	0	0	INCOMPLETE BID
6	5	5	5	5	INCOMPLETE BID
7	10	10	10	10	INCOMPLETE BID
8	0	0	0	0	INCOMPLETE BID
9	0	0	0	0	INCOMPLETE BID
	70	55	50	65	0

4.4.3 Networking Cabling					
	Netsync	Sequel Data	Ahead in The Cloud	Converged Networks	Anet Partners
1	35	NO BID	26	NO BID	INCOMPLETE BID
2	5	NO BID	5	NO BID	INCOMPLETE BID
3	10	NO BID	10	NO BID	INCOMPLETE BID
4	30	NO BID	30	NO BID	INCOMPLETE BID
5	5	NO BID	0	NO BID	INCOMPLETE BID
6	5	NO BID	5	NO BID	INCOMPLETE BID
7	10	NO BID	10	NO BID	INCOMPLETE BID
8	0	NO BID	0	NO BID	INCOMPLETE BID
9	0	NO BID	0	NO BID	INCOMPLETE BID
	100	0	86	0	0

Mission Consolidated Independent School District
 Bid Evaluation
 E-Rate Round 29 Internet Access and Internal Connections - RFP# 345-26-1

4.4.4 Network Infrastructure Hardware					
	Netsync	Sequel Data	Ahead in The Cloud	Converged Networks	Anet Partners
1	22	24	22	35	INCOMPLETE BID
2	5	5	5	5	INCOMPLETE BID
3	10	10	10	10	INCOMPLETE BID
4	30	20	10	5	INCOMPLETE BID
5	5	5	0	0	INCOMPLETE BID
6	5	5	5	5	INCOMPLETE BID
7	10	2	10	10	INCOMPLETE BID
8	0	0	0	0	INCOMPLETE BID
9	0	0	0	0	INCOMPLETE BID
	87	71	62	70	0

4.4.5 Wireless Hardware					
	Netsync	Sequel Data	Ahead in The Cloud	Converged Networks	Anet Partners
1	22	35	22	24	INCOMPLETE BID
2	5	5	5	5	INCOMPLETE BID
3	10	10	10	10	INCOMPLETE BID
4	30	30	25	20	INCOMPLETE BID
5	5	5	0	0	INCOMPLETE BID
6	5	5	5	5	INCOMPLETE BID
7	10	10	10	10	INCOMPLETE BID
8	0	0	0	0	INCOMPLETE BID
9	0	0	0	0	INCOMPLETE BID
	87	100	77	74	0

4.4.6 Uninterruptible Power Supply					
	Netsync	Sequel Data	Ahead in The Cloud	Converged Networks	Anet Partners
1	10	NO BID	22	35	INCOMPLETE BID
2	5	NO BID	5	5	INCOMPLETE BID
3	10	NO BID	10	10	INCOMPLETE BID
4	30	NO BID	0	0	INCOMPLETE BID
5	5	NO BID	0	0	INCOMPLETE BID
6	5	NO BID	5	5	INCOMPLETE BID
7	10	NO BID	10	10	INCOMPLETE BID
8	0	NO BID	0	0	INCOMPLETE BID
9	0	NO BID	0	0	INCOMPLETE BID
	75	0	52	65	0

Evaluation Committee

Noe Pena - Director for Technology Systems

Jose Alberto Gonzalez - E-Rate/Network Coordinator

Notes:

Netsync - Hardware submitted meets the requested specifications or demonstrates functional equivalency.

Sequel - 4.4.2 Hardware does not meet the requested specifications or demonstrate functional equivalency. 4.4.4 Hardware does not meet the requested specifications or demonstrate functional equivalency.

Ahead in the Cloud - 4.4.2 Hardware does not meet the requested specifications or demonstrate functional equivalency. 4.4.6 Hardware does not meet the requested specifications or demonstrate functional equivalency.

Converged Networks - 4.4.2 Hardware does not meet the requested specifications or demonstrate functional equivalency. 4.4.4 Hardware does not meet the requested specifications or demonstrate functional equivalency. 4.4.6 Hardware Does not meet the requested specifications or demonstrate functional equivalency.

Anet Partners - Incomplete Bid. The bid submission does not provide the level of detail, documentation, and explanation necessary for the District to evaluate functionality, equivalency, and compliance with the stated RFP requirements.