



Award Notice

FY2026 Term Contract:	340-26-0 Technology Resources (Catalog)
Awarded To:	1. <u>525 Technologies</u> 2. <u>AiSYS Consulting, LLC</u> 3. <u>Camcor, Inc</u> 4. <u>CDW Government, LLC</u> 5. <u>Delcom Group</u> 6. <u>Gateway Printing & Office Supply, Inc.</u> 7. <u>JSJ Rodriguez, Inc. dab Telepro Communications</u> 8. <u>Virtucom, Inc.</u>
Term:	One Year/One(One-year) option to renew
Term Period:	January 2026 – December 2026

Mission Consolidated Independent School District
Tabulation Form
Technology Resources (Catalog) #340-26-0

525 Technologies Sean Bevan	Vendor # 800-536-9953 x700	525bids@525technologies.com
Category Description	Catalog Discount as a Percentage	Notes
Catalog Price Discount	1%	1% off MSRP minimum discount
Manufacture Price Discount	1%	1% off MSRP minimum discount

AISYS Consulting, LLC Elizabeth Lopez	Vendor # 8880 956-686-0101	elopez@aisysconsulting.com
Category Description	Catalog Discount as a Percentage	Notes
Catalog Price Discount	5%	Catalog does not include freight fees. Please call
Custom Price Discount	5%	Catalog does not include freight fees. Please call

Camcor, Inc Will Benton	Vendor # 9524 800-868-2462	bids@camcor.com
Category Description	Catalog Discount as a Percentage	Notes
Catalog Price Discount	3%	Discount from Camcor catalog/website pricing and is applicable to all items, except where prohibited by manufacturer pricing restrictions
Internet/Online Price Discount	3%	

CDW Government LLC Mike Smith	Vendor # 90237 312-705-8788	mike.smith@cdw.com
Category Description	Catalog Discount as a Percentage	Notes
Catalog Price Discount	0%	Please see Attached TIPS catalog discounts
Manufacture Price Discount	0%	
Custom Price Discount	0%	
Internet/On-Line Price Discount	0%	
Shelf Price Discount	0%	

Delcom Group TJ Garry	Vendor # 108120 512-799-0582	tgarry@delcomgroup.com
Category Description	Catalog Discount as a Percentage	Notes
Catalog Price Discount	0%	
Manufacture Price Discount	0%	
Custom Price Discount	0%	
Internet/On-Line Price Discount	0%	
Shelf Price Discount	0%	

Gateway Printing & Office Supply Inc. Chris Diaz	Vendor # 30290 956-383-3861	cdiaz@gatewayvp.com
Category Description	Catalog Discount as a Percentage	Notes
Catalog Price Discount	86%	Discount up to 86%
Manufacture Price Discount	86%	Discount up to 86%
Custom Price Discount	86%	Discount up to 86%
Internet/On-Line Price Discount	86%	Discount up to 86%
Shelf Price Discount	86%	Discount up to 86%

JSJ Rodriguez Inc dba Telepro Communications Daniel Backhaus	Vendor # 11791 956-618-2360 ext209	daniel@teleprocommunications.com
Category Description	Catalog Discount as a Percentage	Notes
Manufacture Price Discount	10%	10% Discount Off MSRP

Virtucom, Inc Sean Beck	Vendor # 104970 678-757-4982	sbeck@virtucom.com
Category Description	Catalog Discount as a Percentage	Notes
Catalog Price Discount	3%	3% discount: https://global.channelonline.com/virtucom/storesite
Manufacture Price Discount	3%	3% discount



Award Notice

FY2026 Term Contract:	340-26-0 Technology Resources (Line Item)
Awarded To:	1. <u>AiSYS Consulting, LLC</u> 2. <u>CDW Government, LLC</u> 3. <u>JSJ Rodriguez, Inc.</u> 4. <u>Netsync</u> 5. <u>Virtucom, Inc.</u>
Term:	One Year/One(One-year) option to renew
Term Period:	January 2026 – December 2026

Mission Consolidated Independent School District
Tabulation Form
Technology Resources (Line Items) #340-26-0

					AISYS Consulting, LLC		CDW Government LLC		JSJ Rodriguez Inc. dba Telpro Communications		Netsync		Vituum, Inc	
					Contact Name:	Elizabeth Lopez	Contact Name:	Mike Smith	Contact Name:	Daniel Backhaus	Contact Name:	Xavier Trevino	Contact Name:	Sean Beck
					Phone #	356-686-0101	Phone #	321-705-8788	Phone #	956-618-2360 ext 209	Phone #	956-340-2126	Phone #	678-757-4982
					Email	elopez@aisysconsulting.com	Email	mike.smith@cdw.com	Email	daniel@telprocommunications.com	Email	xtrevino@netsync.com	Email	sbeck@vituum.com
VENDOR NAME:														
#	Items	Application	Description	Manufacturer	Unit Price	Notes	Unit Price	Notes	Unit Price	Notes	Unit Price	Notes	Unit Price	Notes
#0-1	Portable Projection Screens	Classroom/Lab/Office	12x9 Portable Projection Screen	Da-lite	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$1,790.64	N/A	\$1,795.29	See Quote#AAAQ447240	No Bid	No Bid
#0-2	15' HDMI Cable	Classroom/Lab/Office	15' HDMI Cable		\$7.99	15' HDMI Cable	\$10.00	HDM2HDMI15F-PRO	\$17.99	N/A	\$16.44	See Quote#AAAQ447240	No Bid	No Bid
#0-3	20' HDMI Cable	Classroom/Lab/Office	20' HDMI Cable		\$13.25	20' HDMI Cable	\$12.00	HDMHSM20-PRO	\$25.79	N/A	\$17.66	See Quote#AAAQ447240	No Bid	No Bid
#0-4	50' HDMI Cable	Classroom/Lab/Office	50' HDMI Cable		\$49.45	50' HDMI Cable	\$45.00	HDMHSM50-PRO	\$95.99	N/A	\$26.06	See Quote#AAAQ447240	No Bid	No Bid
#0-5	Display Port to HDMI adapter	Classroom/Lab/Office	Display Port to HDMI adapter		No Bid	No Bid	\$12.50	P136-000	\$17.45	N/A	\$16.91	See Quote#AAAQ447240	No Bid	No Bid
#0-6	Audio Mixer	Office/Other	Audio Mixer		\$89.92	Mackie Mix5 5-channel Compact Mixer	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$332.98	See Quote#AAAQ447240	No Bid	No Bid
#0-7	Cart devices COW	Classroom	YES36 Adjusta Charging Cart	Ergotron	No Bid	No Bid	\$1,490.00	YES36-CHR-1	\$2,623.19	N/A	\$1,680.49	See Quote#AAAQ447240	No Bid	No Bid
#0-8	Charging station	Classroom	YES20 Charging Cabinet	Ergotron	No Bid	No Bid	\$905.00	YESCABGMPW	\$1,412.99	N/A	\$910.71	See Quote#AAAQ447240	No Bid	No Bid
#0-9	Chargers		Apple iPad Air charger	Apple or equivalent	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$22.80	N/A	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
#0-10	Chargers		Apple iPad 9th Generation charger	Apple or equivalent	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$22.80	N/A	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
#0-11	Chargers		Apple iPad 10th Generation charger	Apple or equivalent	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$22.80	N/A	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
#0-12	Chargers		Lenovo Chromebook Charger USB-C	Lenovo or equivalent	No Bid	No Bid	\$19.15	AC-65W	\$17.99	N/A	\$41.06	See Quote#AAAQ447240	\$29.95	4X20M26268 Lenovo 65W AC Adapter
#0-13	Cisco Phones	Office	Cisco 9851	Cisco	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$240.89	N/A	\$190.32	Quote# AAAQ447170	No Bid	No Bid
#0-14	Cisco Phones	Classroom/Lab/Office	Cisco 9841	Cisco	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$192.30	N/A	\$151.87	Quote# AAAQ447170	No Bid	No Bid
#0-15	Speakers	Classroom/Lab/Office	Logitech Z150 for PC	Logitech	No Bid	No Bid	\$23.50	980-000802	\$35.99	N/A	\$23.37	See Quote#AAAQ447240	\$26.95	980000802 Z150 Multimedia Speaker Mid Bk
#0-16	Display Adapters	Classroom/Lab/Office	DP-HDMI and DP-VGA		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$50.05	N/A	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
#0-17	Document Camera	Classroom	Ladibug DC193 Document Camera	Lumens	\$575.00	Ladibug DC193	\$505.00	VISF50PLS	\$640.91	N/A	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
#0-18	ID card Printers	Classroom/Lab/Office	ID card printer		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$3,813.46	N/A	\$543.41	See Quote#AAAQ447240	No Bid	No Bid
#0-19	Lanschool Software	Classroom/Lab/Office	Lanschool	Lanschool	No Bid	No Bid	\$6.72	4L40Y99063	No Bid	No Bid	\$2,107.79	See Quote#AAAQ447240	No Bid	No Bid
#0-20	Switch	Classroom/Lab/Office	NETGEAR 8-Port Gigabit Ethernet Switch, Plug-and-Play (GS108)	Netgear	No Bid	No Bid	\$46.99	GS108-400NAS	\$68.22	N/A	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
#0-21	Switch	Classroom/Lab/Office	NETGEAR 16-Port Gigabit Ethernet Unmanaged Switch, Desktop (GS116NA)	Netgear	No Bid	No Bid	\$110.56	GS116NA	\$151.64	N/A	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
#0-22	Projector	Classroom	PowerLite X49 XGA 3LCD Projector, 3600 Lumens, White	Epson	\$410.00	Epson X49	\$382.00	V11H982020	\$495.60	N/A	\$443.77	See Quote#AAAQ447240	No Bid	No Bid
#0-26	Projector	Classroom	PowerLite L520W - 3LCD projector - 5200 lumens	Epson	\$1,780.00	Epson L520W	\$1,550.00	V11HA31020	\$2,190.00	N/A	\$1,961.94	See Quote#AAAQ447240	No Bid	No Bid
#0-27	Projector Mount	Classroom	Universal ceiling projector mount	Chief, Peerless or equivalent	\$120.00	Universal Projector Mount	\$165.00	RPAU	\$183.41	N/A	\$102.46	See Quote#AAAQ447240	No Bid	No Bid
#0-28	Remote Control	Classroom/Lab/Office	Logitech Professional Presenter R800	Logitech	No Bid	No Bid	\$47.19	910-001350	\$59.99	N/A	\$43.96	See Quote#AAAQ447240	\$47.50	910001350 Professional Presenter R800
#0-29	Projector	Office/Other	PowerLite 535W WXGA 3LCD Projector	Epson	No Bid	No Bid	\$1,263.90	V11H993020	\$1,699.20	N/A	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
#0-30	Small PA speaker and mic combo	Office/Other	Beringer	Beringer	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$994.80	N/A	\$425.91	See Quote#AAAQ447240	No Bid	No Bid
#0-31	SMART Board	Classroom	SMART	SMART Technologies	\$428.00	SMART Technologies FS-SBID-200	\$390.00	RFCUB	\$2,082.00	N/A	\$390.34	See Quote#AAAQ447240	No Bid	No Bid
#0-32	SMART Board Mount	Classroom	SMART	SMART Technologies	\$75.00	Extra Large Wall Mount	\$53.60	WM-SBID-200	\$538.80	N/A	\$62.69	See Quote#AAAQ447240	No Bid	No Bid
#0-33	SMART Panel	Classroom	- 5 Year SMART Learning Suite license - 5 Year Manufacturer's Warranty	SMART Technologies	\$3,958.00	- 5 Year SMART Learning Suite license - 5 Year Manufacturer's Warranty	\$4,155.00	MX275-V5 + ED-SW-5 + WM-SBID-200 + HDM2HDMI15F-PRO + USBAA015 + INSTALL	\$6,598.80	N/A	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
#0-34	SMART Panel	Classroom	- 5 Year SMART Learning Suite license - 5 Year Manufacturer's Warranty	SMART Technologies	\$5,399.00	- 5 Year SMART Learning Suite license - 5 Year Manufacturer's Warranty	\$5,415.00	MX275-V5 + ED-SW-5 + WM-SBID-200 + HDM2HDMI15F-PRO + USBAA015 + INSTALL	\$8,998.80	N/A	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
#0-35	SMART Software Renewal	Classroom	Smart Software license renewal	SMART Technologies	\$175.00	5 Year Software Renewal	\$200.00	ED-SW-5	\$1,198.80	N/A	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
#0-36	Sony Camera	Office/Other	SONY "A-6100 CAMERA W/16-50 LENS	Sony	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$1,019.99	N/A	\$1,127.02	See Quote#AAAQ447240	No Bid	No Bid
#0-37	Video Switcher	Office/Other	Roland VR1-HD	Roland	\$979.00	Roland SR-20HD replaced the discontinued Roland VR1-HD	No Bid	No Bid	\$1,194.00	N/A	\$50.84	See Quote#AAAQ447240	No Bid	No Bid
#0-38	Wireless Keyboard	Classroom/Office	Wireless Keyboard	Logitech	No Bid	No Bid	\$20.00	920-003051	\$29.99	N/A	\$18.65	See Quote#AAAQ447240	\$71.50	920012424 K950 Signature Slim Keyboard Grph
#0-39	Wireless Keyboard and Mouse combo	Classroom/Office	Wireless Keyboard and Mouse combo	Logitech	No Bid	No Bid	\$17.50	920-002714	\$29.99	N/A	\$23.37	See Quote#AAAQ447240	\$25.40	920007897 MK235 Wireless Combo
#0-40	Wireless Mouse	Classroom/Office	Logitech	Logitech	No Bid	No Bid	\$14.51	910-004940	\$17.99	N/A	\$13.18	See Quote#AAAQ447240	\$18.50	910006525 M325S Wireless Mouse Black
#0-41	HP, Lenovo, or Dell Chromebook	Classroom	*4GB or 8GB RAM *32GB Storage	HP, LENOVO, OR DELL	No Bid	No Bid	\$312.50	DIS-EDU-NEW + ASPCMCHSDCCW600CHMUCAD36D	No Bid	No Bid	\$389.85	See Quote#AAAQ447243	\$358.00	32GB Chromebook, Google Management License, case, and 3-
#0-42	Raptor ID scanner	Office	Raptor ID Scanner	Raptor Technologies	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$804.00	N/A	\$294.72	See Quote#AAAQ447240	No Bid	No Bid
#0-43	Headsets	Classroom	Headset	Gumdrop, or equivalent	No Bid	No Bid	\$1.80	2AE0-8STERE-O32	\$22.67	N/A	\$4.04	See Quote#AAAQ447240	\$9.98	AC-4000 Cyber Acoustics Headset (3.5mm adapter)
#0-44	Headset with microphone	Classroom	Headset with microphone	Gumdrop, or equivalent	No Bid	No Bid	\$10.00	AC-CDW-HPM	\$27.20	N/A	\$23.23	See Quote#AAAQ447240	\$14.80	AC-4005 Cyber Acoustics Headset (USB-A)
#0-45	CAT 6 Ethernet Patch Cables	Classroom/Office	10ft Patch Cable	CommScope or equivalent	\$4.25	10' Patch cable	No Bid	No Bid	\$12.00	N/A	\$8.36	See Quote#AAAQ447240	No Bid	No Bid
#0-46	CAT 6 Ethernet Patch Cables	Classroom/Office	15ft Patch Cable	CommScope or equivalent	\$6.25	15' Patch cable	No Bid	No Bid	\$14.40	N/A	\$8.74	See Quote#AAAQ447240	No Bid	No Bid
#0-47	CAT 6 Ethernet Patch Cables	Classroom/Office	25ft Patch Cable	CommScope or equivalent	\$8.25	25' Patch Cable	No Bid	No Bid	\$18.00	N/A	\$10.90	See Quote#AAAQ447240	No Bid	No Bid
#0-48	CAT 6 Ethernet Patch Cables	Classroom/Office	30ft Patch Cable	CommScope or equivalent	\$10.02	30' patch cable	No Bid	No Bid	\$21.60	N/A	\$14.11	See Quote#AAAQ447240	No Bid	No Bid
#0-49	Surge Protector	Classroom/Office	6ft 6 Outlet Surge Protector	Belkin or equivalent	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$18.46	N/A	\$17.25	See Quote#AAAQ447240	No Bid	No Bid
#0-50	Surge Protector	Classroom/Office	Eaton Tripp Lite Series Safety Surge Protector 120V 8 Outlet Metal 25' Cord surge protector	Eaton Tripp Lite	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$49.56	N/A	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
#0-51	TV	Classroom/Office	55 in commercial or professional TV	LG, Samsung or equivalent	\$570.31	SAMSUNG 55" Monitor	No Bid	No Bid	\$955.20	N/A	\$703.45	See Quote#AAAQ447240	\$582.00	4PB55EJZU SHARP 55 AQUOS CommTV 55 in TV
#0-52	TV	Classroom/Office	75 in commercial or professional TV	LG, Samsung or equivalent	\$1,120.00	SAMSUNG 75" monitor	No Bid	No Bid	\$2,000.40	N/A	\$1,803.46	See Quote#AAAQ447240	\$1,058.00	4PB75EJZU SHARP 75 AQUOS CommTV 75 in TV
#0-53	Microphones	Classroom/Office	Handheld Microphone System with PG58 Capsules	Shure	\$547.88	Shure BLX288/PG58	No Bid	No Bid	\$540.10	N/A	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
#0-54	Microphones	Classroom/Office	Powered 8" PA Speaker with Handheld Wireless System and Bluetooth Control/Audio	Behringer	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$430.80	N/A	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
#0-55	Microphones	Classroom/Office	Electro-Voice ZLX-15P-G2 15" 2-Way 1000W Powered Loudspeaker with Bluetooth (Black)	Electro-Voice	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$1,437.60	N/A	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
#0-56	Microphones	Classroom/Office	Electro-Voice ZLX-15P-G2 15" 2-Way 1000W Powered Loudspeaker with Bluetooth (Black)	Electro-Voice	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$538.80	N/A	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
#0-57	SSD Hard drive	Classroom/Office	Samsung 870 EVO MZ-77E500E - SSD - 500 GB	Samsung	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$65.99	N/A	\$45.53	See Quote#AAAQ447240	No Bid	No Bid