



Award Notice

FY2026 Term Contract:	223-26-0 Special Education Evaluation and Related Services
Awarded To:	1. <u>ABC Therapy, Inc.</u> 2. <u>Abelina Hernandez</u> 3. <u>Barboza Assessment & Consulting, LLC</u> 4. <u>Danny Lopez</u> 5. <u>Hummingbird Speech Services, PLLC</u> 6. <u>JER Special Education Consulting Services</u> 7. <u>L&J Evolutions, Inc.</u> 8. <u>Maria G. Garza</u> 9. <u>Maria G. Rivera</u> 10. <u>RGV Therapist, PLLC</u> 11. <u>Ruth Cardoza, LSSP & Behavioral Specialist</u>
Term:	One Year/One(One-year) option to renew
Term Period:	January 2026 – December 2026

Mission Consolidated Independent School District
Tabulation Form
Special Education Evaluation and Related Services #223-26-0

			ABC Therapy, Inc.		Abelina Hernandez		Applied Pediatrics Inc		Barboza Assessment & Consulting, LLC		BrightSpring Health Services Inc		Danny Lopez		Firefly Professional Services Providers LLC		Hummingbird Speech Services PLLC		JER Special Education Consulting Services		L & J Evolutions, Inc		Maria G. Garza		Maria G. Rivera		National Recruiting Consultants		RGV Therapist, PLLC		Rubin Educational Services, LLC		Ruth Cardoza, LSP & Behavioral Specialist		Texas Educational Therapy Solutions, LLC		Vanessa Gonzalez					
			Annabel Esau 956-393-0052 aesau@mei.com		Abelina (Nina) Hernandez 956-432-7515 nina.hernandez222@gmail.com		George S Rosero 404-909-8130 gsrosero@appliedpediatrics.com		Julissa Barboza 956-562-7841 julissabarboza@mei.com		Juliana Reese 210-370-3099 jreese@brightspringhealthservices.com		Danny Lopez 956-459-948 dlopez177821@hotmail.com		Elizabeth Clarke 214-368-8502 elizabethc@fireflyps.com		Amaris Contreras 956-240-9361 amc@hummingbirdspeech.net		Juanita Rodriguez 956-458-9099 rcardob40@gmail.com		Melissa Caballero 956-222-2689 mcsu55@yahoo.com		Maria G. Garza 956-222-2689 mgarza@yahoo.com		Maria G. Rivera 956-498-4352 mrivera78@aol.com		Stefanie Murphy 972-330-4549 smurphy@ntrrecruiting.com		Rosa Villarreal 956-890-0660 rgtherrays122@gmail.com		Timeka Williams 281-468-4916 twilliamseducational@yahoo.com		Ruth Cardoza 956-342-3622 rcardoza@mei.com		Sara Gomez 956-279-8571 lgomez@yahoo.com		Vanessa L. Gonzalez 956-222-9498 vlgp@yahoo.com					
#	Items	Quantity Required	Unit Price	Notes	Unit Price	Notes	Unit Price	Notes	Unit Price	Notes	Unit Price	Notes	Unit Price	Notes	Unit Price	Notes	Unit Price	Notes	Unit Price	Notes	Unit Price	Notes	Unit Price	Notes	Unit Price	Notes	Unit Price	Notes	Unit Price	Notes	Unit Price	Notes	Unit Price	Notes	Unit Price	Notes	Unit Price	Notes				
#D-1	Full Individual Evaluations (FIE) English are no more than \$700	1	No Bid		\$700.00		\$700.00		\$750.00		No Bid		\$700.00		No Bid		\$700.00		\$700.00		No Bid		\$700.00		\$700.00		No Bid		No Bid		\$700.00		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid			
#D-2	Full Individual Evaluations (FIE) Bilingual are no more than \$750	1	No Bid		\$750.00		\$750.00		\$750.00		No Bid		\$700.00		No Bid		\$750.00		\$750.00		No Bid		\$750.00		\$750.00		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid			
#D-3	Full Individual Evaluations (FIE) with Dyslexia English no more than \$750	1	No Bid		\$750.00		No Bid		\$750.00		No Bid		\$700.00		No Bid		No Bid		\$750.00		No Bid		\$750.00		\$750.00		No Bid		No Bid		\$750.00		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid			
#D-4	Full Individual Evaluations (FIE) with Dyslexia Bilingual are no more than \$750	1	No Bid		\$750.00		No Bid		\$750.00		No Bid		\$700.00		No Bid		No Bid		\$750.00		No Bid		\$750.00		\$750.00		No Bid		No Bid		\$750.00		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid			
#D-5	Counseling Evaluations are no more than \$400	1	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		\$400.00		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		\$400.00		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid			
#D-6	Speech Therapy Evaluations / Re-Evaluations per evaluation	1	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		\$150.00		No Bid		\$200.00		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		\$175.00		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		\$180.00			
#D-7	Speech Therapy Direct Treatment no more than \$15 per 15 minutes	1	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		\$15.00		No Bid		\$45.00		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		\$25.00		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		\$20.00			
#D-8	Speech Therapy Group Treatment no more than \$15 per 15 minutes	1	No Bid		No Bid		\$15.00		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		\$15.00		No Bid		\$45.00		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		\$25.00		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		\$25.00			
#D-9	Attending ARD Meetings for no more than \$125 per student	1	\$125.00		\$125.00		\$125.00		\$125.00		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		\$125.00		\$125.00		No Bid		\$125.00		No Bid		No Bid		\$125.00		No Bid		\$125.00		No Bid		\$125.00		\$125.00		\$100.00	
#D-10	Consultation Session Speech no more than \$15 per 15 minutes	1	No Bid		No Bid		\$15.00		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		\$15.00		No Bid		\$20.00		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		\$25.00		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		\$15.00			
#D-11	Counseling Services are no more than \$25 per 15 minutes	1	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		\$110.00		\$25.00		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid			
#D-12	Physical Therapy Evaluations / Re-evaluations for no more than \$150 per evaluation	1	\$250.00		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		\$200.00		No Bid		No Bid			
#D-13	Consultation Session Physical Therapy no more than \$35 per 15 minutes	1	\$35.00		No Bid		\$35.00		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		\$35.00		No Bid		No Bid			
#D-14	Occupational Therapy is no more than \$75 per hour	1	No Bid		No Bid		\$75.00		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		\$85.00		No Bid		No Bid		\$75.00		No Bid		No Bid			
#D-15	Occupational Therapy Evaluation / Re-evaluations are no more than \$150	1	No Bid		No Bid		\$150.00		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		\$150.00		No Bid		No Bid			
#D-16	Bilingual Therapists for no more than \$75 per hour	1	No Bid		No Bid		\$75.00		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		\$95.00		\$75.00		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		\$87.00		\$125.00		No Bid		No Bid		\$75.00		No Bid		No Bid			
#D-17	Psychologists per hour	1	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		\$110.00		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		\$85.00		No Bid		\$110.00		\$150.00		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid			
#D-18	Six Weeks Progress Reports for Physical Therapy no more than \$20 per form	1	\$20.00		No Bid		\$20.00		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		\$20.00		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid			
#D-19	SHARE Forms for Physical Therapy are no more than \$5 per form	1	\$5.00		No Bid		\$5.00		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		\$5.00		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid			
#D-20	IEPs for Speech are no more than \$125 per form	1	\$125.00		No Bid		\$125.00		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		\$125.00		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		\$125.00		No Bid		\$125.00		\$100.00		No Bid		No Bid			
#D-21	Six Weeks Progress Reports for Speech are no more than \$20 per form	1	No Bid		No Bid		\$20.00		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		\$20.00		No Bid		\$15.00		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		\$20.00		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		\$20.00		No Bid			
#D-22	SHARS Forms for Speech are no more than \$5 per form	1	No Bid		No Bid		\$5.00		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		\$5.00		No Bid		\$5.00		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		\$10.00		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		\$5.00			
#D-23	IEPs for Speech are no more than \$125 per form	1	No Bid		No Bid		\$125.00		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		\$125.00		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		\$125.00		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		\$100.00			

Evaluation Committee Members:
Francisca Cruz - Executive Director for Special Education, ection 504, MTSS & Dyslexia
Sarah S. Lerma - Special Education Coordinator
Sonia Estrada - Special Education Coordinator
Jessica Trevino - Special Education Compliance Coordinator

Notes:
Applied Pediatrics Inc
-Staffing company, employs contract employees, the company is not local to the area
BrightSpring Health Services Inc
-Staffing company, employs contract employees, the company is not local to the area, limited contract services
Firefly Professional Service Providers, LLC
-Staffing agency not local to the area employs contract employees, limited contract services available, charge by hour
National Recruiting Consultants
-Staffing company, employs contractor employees and requires the district to conduct interviews, training, and materials; the company is not local to the area.
Rubin Educational Services, LLC
-Company is not local, and unable to confirm if they have local employees available



Award Notice

FY2026 Term Contract:	223-26-0 Special Education Evaluation and Related Services – Supplemental Bid
Awarded To:	1. <u>Specialized Assessment & Consulting</u> 2. <u>The Guiding Light Visual Impairment Services, LLC.</u>
Term:	One Year/Two (One-year) option to renew
Term Period:	January 2026 – December 2026

**Mission Consolidated Independent School District
Tabulation Form
Special Education Evaluation and Related Services - Supplemental Bid**

			3Chords Inc. and Therapy Travelers, LLC dba Epic Special Education Staffing		Admore Behavioral Therapy		Aequor Healthcare Services, LLC.		Assessment Intervention Management, LLC.		ESS Clinical, Inc.		Olive Branch Education Services, LLC		Point Quest Therapeutic Services, LLC		Specialized Assessment & Consulting		Texas Therapy Consultants		The Guiding Light Visual Impairment Services, LLC	
			Carol Cheney, M.S., CCC-SLP 888-223-8002		Christel Ebenson 713-910-0296		John Anderson 610-405-6913		Amy McPartlin/Analilia Moreno 210-838-5351		Blake Warren 636-432-6107		Wendy Oliver 281-330-2475		Kimberly Loner, Med 346-466-8335		James Hitchcock 346-240-1000		Nakeysha R. Wilson 832-615-4902		Veronica Flores 956-424-5813	
			rfp@epicstaffinggroup.com		cebenson@admoregroup.com		john.anderson@aequor.com		bids@aimeducate.com		bwarren@ess.com		obeducservices@gmail.com		kloner@pointquestgroup.com		contracts@specializedtx.com		admin@ttconsultants.net		guidinglightvi@gmail.com	
#	Items	Quantity Required	Unit Price	Notes	Unit Price	Notes	Unit Price	Notes	Unit Price	Notes			Unit Price	Notes	Unit Price	Notes	Unit Price	Notes	Unit Price	Notes	Unit Price	Notes
#0-1	Orientation and Mobility Services (O&M)	1	\$66.00	Per hour			\$75.00	Per hour	\$100.00	\$110 Bilingual per hour	\$75.00 - \$85.00				\$82.00	Per hour	\$128.00	Per hour			\$650.00	Day Rate
#0-2	Visual Impairment Services (VI)	1	\$78.00	Per hour			\$79.00	Per hour	\$100.00	\$110 Bilingual per hour	\$72.50 - \$82.50				\$82.00	Per hour	\$128.00	Per hour			\$550.00	Day Rate

Evaluation Committee Members:
Francisca Cruz - Executive Director for Special Education, Section 504, MTSS & Dyslexia
Erika Miller Morales - Special Education Coordinator
Sonia Estrada - Special Education Coordinator
Jessica Trevino - Special Education Compliance Coordinator

Notes:
3Chords Inc. and Therapy Travelers, LLC dba Epic Special Education Staffing
Staffing company, O&M not readily available
Admore Behavioral Therapy
Staffing company, no VI or O&M
Aequor Healthcare
Staffing company, O&M not readily available
Assesment Intervention Management, LLC
Staffing company
ESS Clinical, Inc.
Staffing company, O&M not readily available
Olive Branch Education Services, LLC
No VI or O&M
Point Quest Therapeutic Services, LLC
Staffing company, O&M not readily available
Texas Therapy Consultants
No VI or O&M available



22-26-0 - Special Education Evaluation and Related Services - Supplemental Bid Scoring Summary

Active Submissions

	Total	Price	Reputation of Vendor and of Vendor's goods and/or services	Quality of Vendor's goods and/or services	Extent to which the goods and/or services meet the Mission CISD's needs	Vendor's past relationship with Mission CISD
Supplier	/ 100 pts	/ 35 pts	/ 25 pts	/ 20 pts	/ 15 pts	/ 5 pts
The Guiding Light Visual Impairment Services LLC	56.25	-	19	17.25	15	5
Specialized Assessment & Consulting	41.5	-	16.75	12.5	12	0.25
ADMORE BEHAVIORAL THERAPY	21.25	-	11.75	5.5	3.5	0.5
Aequor Healthcare Services, LLC	20.5	-	9	7.25	4	0.25
OLIVE BRANCH Education Services, LLC	19.5	-	11	5.5	2.75	0.25
Texas Therapy Consultants	19.5	-	11	5.5	2.75	0.25
3Chords Inc. and TherapyTravelers, LLC collectively DBA Epic Special Education Staffing	18.75	-	9	5.5	4	0.25
Assessment Intervention Management, LLC	18.75	-	9	5.5	4	0.25
ESS Clinical, Inc.	18.75	-	9	5.5	4	0.25
Point Quest Therapeutic Services LLC	18.75	-	9	5.5	4	0.25