ING THE

FUTURE}
MISSTON

FY2025 Term Contract:

Instructional Technology Software #211-25-5

Awarded To: 1. Sirius Education Solutions
Term: One Year/One year option to renew
Term Period : July 2024 — June 2025




Mission Consolidated Independent School District

Tabulation Form

Instructional Technology Software 211-25-5

Total Cost
Selected #

Attainment Company, Inc. EREFLECT INC Eye On Mastery Magma Math Multimedia Solutions, Inc.
Vendor #772 Vendor # Vendor #38065 Vendor # Vendor #101904
Kandi Lockard Rick Mesias Mike Ringen Leslie Nielsen Bernadette Kuttel

800-327-4269

707-702-2308

888-470-1129

425-985-5479

888-989-1285 or 239-331-0548

bisspec@attainmentcompany.com

rick@ereflect.com

info@eyeonmastery.com

leslie@magmamath.com

S0

$11,776.00

$60,096.00

bkuttel@multimedia-fl.com

$64,000.00

$63,269.00

0

0

0

0

0

Items

Quantity
Required

Unit
Price

Total
Notes Cost

Unit

Total
Price Notes

Cost

Unit Total
Price Notes Cost

Unit
Price

Notes

Total
Cost

Unit Total
Price Notes Cost

#0-1

Cost per Student Software

6400

Free to District

$1.84 [NA $11,776.00

$1.89 |per student $12,096.00

$1

o

For a district wide
adoption we offer a
10% discount

$64,000.00

Per User Per year based
on a one year

$9.70 |subscription $62,080.00

#0-2

Cost per Campus Software (if
applicable)

Free to District

No Bid

$5,000.00 |per HS/JH campus $45,000.00

No Bid

Unit price is based on
750 users per
campus.($15,360)Per
User Per year based on
a one year subscription.
Call for customized
quote for each campus-

$21 [tier pricing applies. $189

#0-3

Professional Development for
4 hours

$  500.00

NoBid |$ 500.00

$3,000.00 |per inservice $3,000.00

$

o

Free with adoption

$0

Remote training
avialable - quoted at 4
$1,000.00 |hours

$1,000.00

Additional Responses

Several
Additional
pricing see
attach




Mission Consolidated Independent School District
Tabulation Form
Instructional Technology Software 211-25-5

Newsela, Inc. Group LLC Savvas Learning Company LLC Sirius. The Writing Academy, LLC
Vendor # Vendor # Vendor # Vendor #101517 Vendor #99904
Beth Han Mark Moreno Pamela McNair Annette Baker Kelley Kratky
310-739-7062 512-470-4940 201-928-7770 800-942-1379 281-549-4466
m k om m kelley@twa.net
Total Cost $106,040.00 $29,264.00 5$160,000.00 $103,400.00 $79,405.00
Selected # [ [ [ [ [
Quantity Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit | | Total
# Items Required Price Notes Cost Price Notes Cost Price Notes Cost Price Notes Cost Price Notes Cost
Prices decrease based
Per student per off quantity of specific
Newsela ELA, year/digital; items ordered Level 2 Year-
Newsela Social Performance teacher Campus packages are Long
Studies; Newsela Matters licenses are per also available, priced subscription
Science (Newsela Assessment & head not per per student. Please see of our Big
does not offer Advanced campus (see "additional responses" Resources
#0-1 Cost per Student Software 6400 $16.10 |Math products) $103,040.00 $4.40 |Reporting $28,160.00 $25 |catalog) $160,000.00 $16 |for more details. $102,400.00 $12 |App $76,800.00
Cost per Campus Software (if
#0-2 applicable) 9 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
SPL101/102 - 1hr and
cost $1000.00. See the
price sheet for other
classes and costs.
All other trainings are 2- 1 6-hour
4 hours. inservice (Full
Four Virtual 90-min Virtual and eLearning Day)
Professional Development for| Professional Performance are complimentary and including
#0-3 |4 hours 1 $3,000.00 | Learning Sessions $3,000.00 $1,104.00 |Matters PD $1,104.00 No Bid $1,000.00 |2 hrs. $1,000.00 || $2,605.00 |travel. $2,605.00
Additional Responses Additional Responses
SOFRL sold district-wide
Optional Schoology only 10001-25000
$5.00 |LMS Subscription $32,000.00 $13 |licenses $83,200.00
SOFRL sold district-wide
Optional Schoology only 5001-10000
$1,104.00 |LMS PD $1,104.00 $14 |licenses $89,600.00
Optional Schoology SOFRL sold district-wide
$5,278.00 |LMS Depl $5,278.00 $15 |only 1000-5000 licenses |  $96,000.00
Required
Performance SOFRL sold district-wide
Matters only less than 1000
$13,553.00 | Depl $13,553.00 $16 |licenses $102,400.00
SOESP, SOMSP, SOHSP
sold campus-side only
$18 |10001-25000 licenses $115,200.00
SOESP, SOMSP, SOHSP
sold campus-side only
$19 |5001-10000 licenses $121,600.00
SOESP, SOMSP, SOHSP
sold campus-side only
$20 |1000-5000 licenses $128,000.00
SOESP, SOMSP, SOHSP
sold campus-side only
$21 |less than 1000 licenses $134,400.00
Individual suject 10001-
$15 25000 licenses $96,000.00
Individual subject 5001-
$16 10000 licenses $102,400.00
Individual subject 100-
$17 |5000 licenses $108,800.00
Individual subject less
$18 |than 1000 licenses $115,200.00




Mission Consolidated Independent School District
Evaluation Matrix
Instructional Technology Software #211-25-5

Vendors
Bid Evaluation Matrix Savvas Learning Sirius
Eye on Mastery| Newsela Inc .
Company Education
Criteria WETG] S 60,096.00 | S 106,040.00 | S 160,000.00 | $ 103,400.00
Price of service/product (40 points)
Base Proposal 40 40 23 1 23
Meet district's needs (56 points)
Product services all core content areas, math , science, english and social 10 3 3 10 10
studies for 6th - 12th grade.
Product includes an online assessment platform that is comparable to the 10 4 3 5 10
STAAR online platform.
- . . 8 3 8 8 8
Product has the capability for synchronous and asynchronous instruction.
Product integrates with Clever. 8 0 8 8 8
Product integrates with Google Classroom. 6 0 6 6 6
Product includes interactive question formats such as drag and drop, hot
. . 8 8 1 5 8
spot, equation editor, etc.
The product has the capability of teacher and class specific options such as
. . . . . 6 6 6 6 6
assignment creation with automatic grading.
Past relationship with vendor (4 points) 4 2 0 4 4
Total 100 66 >8 64 83

Committee Members:

Vanessa Ojeda, Math Coordinator

Judy Rodriguez, Social Studies Coordinator
James Shults, Science Coordinator
Diamond Tijerina, RLA Coordinator

Notes:

Removal of 6 vendors due to not meeting the RFP's standard specifications

Eye on Mastery only available in Math and does not integrate with Clever and Google Classroom
Newsela is limited on core subjects and not STAAR integrative





