



CHANGING THE  
**WORLD**  
THEIR FUTURE,  
OUR MISSION

FY2023 Term Contract:	Branding Rights for Mission CISD's Game Day Athletic Uniforms #204-23-0
Awarded To:	1. <u>BSN Sports</u>
Term:	Three years
Term Period :	September 2022 – June 2025



Mission Consolidated Independent School District  
Tabulation Form  
Branding Rights for Mission CISD's Game Day Athletic Uniforms 204-23-0

Selected #		Athletic Supply, Inc. DBA Game One			BSN Sports			It's Greek To Me, Inc			PSG Ventures LLC dba PASADENA SPORTING GOODS		
		Vendor #104430			Vendor #19180			Vendor #3701			Vendor #106655		
		Alicia Woodman			Chris Bloomfield			James L Bohnenblust			Tony Alvarez		
		956-245-0549			800-527-7510 x7324			800-336-4486			956-529-6029		
		<a href="mailto:alicia.woodman@game-one.com">alicia.woodman@game-one.com</a>			<a href="mailto:bsnbid@bsnsports.com">bsnbid@bsnsports.com</a>			<a href="mailto:mhk-gtmbids@hanes.com">mhk-gtmbids@hanes.com</a>			<a href="mailto:talvarez@team-psg.com">talvarez@team-psg.com</a>		
		0			0			0			0		
#	Items	Discount %	Proposed Brand	Notes	Discount %	Proposed Brand	Notes	Discount %	Proposed Brand	Notes	Discount %	Proposed Brand	Notes
1	Football												
#1-1	MHS - Jersey Home	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS	15%	Champion	Ultrafuse Compliant Jersey U551TU/TY	40%	ADIDAS	\$ 210.00
#1-2	MHS - Jersey Away	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS	15%	Champion	Ultrafuse Compliant Jersey U551TU/TY	40%	ADIDAS	\$ 210.00
#1-3	MHS - Pants	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS		No Bid		40%	ADIDAS	\$ 135.00
#1-4	MHS - Shoes	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	35%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS		No Bid		35%	ADIDAS	\$ 120.00
#1-5	MHS - Socks	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS		No Bid		40%	ADIDAS	6/PK \$40.00
#1-6	VMHS - Jersey Home	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS	15%	Champion	Ultrafuse Compliant Jersey U551TU/TY	40%	ADIDAS	\$ 210.00
#1-7	VMHS - Jersey Away	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS	15%	Champion	Ultrafuse Compliant Jersey U551TU/TY	40%	ADIDAS	\$ 210.00
#1-8	VMHS - Pants	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS		No Bid		40%	ADIDAS	\$ 135.00
#1-9	VMHS - Shoes	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	35%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS		No Bid		35%	ADIDAS	\$ 120.00
#1-10	VMHS - Socks	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS		No Bid		40%	ADIDAS	6/PK \$40.00
2	Boys Cross Country												
#2-1	MHS - Singlet	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS	15%	Champion	Ultrafuse track singlet U001TU/TY	40%	ADIDAS	\$ 70.00
#2-2	MHS - Shorts	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS	15%	Champion	Ultrafuse track short U001BU/BY	40%	ADIDAS	\$ 70.00
#2-3	MHS - Pants	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS	15%	Champion	Ultrafuse Warm-Up pant U701BU/BY	40%	ADIDAS	\$ 65.00
#2-4	MHS - Shoes	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	35%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS		No Bid		35%	ADIDAS	\$ 110.00
#2-5	MHS - Socks	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS		No Bid		40%	ADIDAS	6/PK \$40.00
#2-6	VMHS - Singlet	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS	15%	Champion	Ultrafuse track singlet U001TU/TY	40%	ADIDAS	\$ 70.00
#2-7	VMHS - Shorts	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS	15%	Champion	Ultrafuse track short U001BU/BY	40%	ADIDAS	\$ 70.00
#2-8	VMHS - Pants	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS	15%	Champion	Ultrafuse Warm-Up pant U701BU/BY	40%	ADIDAS	\$ 65.00
#2-9	VMHS - Shoes	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	35%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS		No Bid		35%	ADIDAS	\$ 110.00
#2-10	VMHS - Socks	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS		No Bid		40%	ADIDAS	6/PK \$40.00
#2-11	MHS - Shorts	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS		No Bid		40%	ADIDAS	\$ 70.00
3	Girls Cross Country												
#3-1	MHS - Singlet	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS	15%	Champion	Ultrafuse Track singlet U001TL	40%	ADIDAS	\$ 70.00
#3-2	MHS - Shorts	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS	15%	Champion	Ultrafuse Track short U001BL	40%	ADIDAS	\$ 70.00
#3-3	MHS - Shoes	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	35%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS		No Bid		35%	ADIDAS	\$ 110.00
#3-4	MHS - Pants	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS	15%	Champion	Ultrafuse Warm-Up pant U702BL	40%	ADIDAS	\$ 65.00
#3-5	MHS - Socks	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS		No Bid		40%	ADIDAS	6/PK \$40.00
#3-6	VMHS - Jersey Home	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS	15%	Champion	Ultrafuse Track singlet U001TL	40%	ADIDAS	\$ 70.00
#3-7	VMHS - Jersey Away	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS	15%	Champion	Ultrafuse Track short U001BL	40%	ADIDAS	\$ 70.00
#3-8	VMHS - Pants	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS	15%	Champion	Ultrafuse Warm-Up pant U702BL	40%	ADIDAS	\$ 65.00
#3-9	VMHS - Shoes	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	35%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS		No Bid		35%	ADIDAS	\$ 110.00
#3-10	VMHS - Socks	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS		No Bid		40%	ADIDAS	6/PK \$40.00
4	Volleyball												
#4-1	MHS - Jersey Home	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS	15%	Champion	Ultrafuse short sleeve Volleyball jersey U200TL/TG	40%	ADIDAS	\$ 75.00
#4-2	MHS - Jersey Away	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS	15%	Champion	Ultrafuse short sleeve Volleyball jersey U200TL/TG	40%	ADIDAS	\$ 75.00
#4-3	MHS - 4" Tights	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS	15%	Champion	Ultrafuse 4" compression short U003BL	40%	ADIDAS	\$ 45.00
#4-4	MHS - Shoes	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	35%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS		No Bid		35%	ADIDAS	\$ 130.00
#4-5	MHS - Socks	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS		No Bid		40%	ADIDAS	6/PK \$40.00
#4-6	VMHS - Jersey Home	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS	15%	Champion	Ultrafuse short sleeve Volleyball jersey U200TL/TG	40%	ADIDAS	\$ 75.00
#4-7	VMHS - Jersey Away	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS	15%	Champion	Ultrafuse short sleeve Volleyball jersey U200TL/TG	40%	ADIDAS	\$ 75.00
#4-8	VMHS - 4" Tights	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS	15%	Champion	Ultrafuse 4" compression short U003BL	40%	ADIDAS	\$ 45.00
#4-9	VMHS - Shoes	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	35%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS		No Bid		35%	ADIDAS	\$ 130.00
#4-10	VMHS - Socks	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS		No Bid		40%	ADIDAS	6/PK \$40.00
5	Boys Track												
#5-1	MHS - Jersey Singlet	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS	15%	Champion	Ultrafuse track singlet U001TU/TY	40%	ADIDAS	\$ 75.00
#5-2	MHS - Shorts	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS	15%	Champion	Ultrafuse track short U001BU/BY	40%	ADIDAS	\$ 75.00
#5-3	MHS - Pants	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS	15%	Champion	Ultrafuse Warm-Up pant U701BU/BY	40%	ADIDAS	\$ 65.00
#5-4	MHS - Shoes	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	35%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS		No Bid		35%	ADIDAS	\$ 110.00
#5-5	MHS - Socks	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS		No Bid		40%	ADIDAS	6/PK \$40.00
#5-6	VMHS - Jersey Singlet	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS	15%	Champion	Ultrafuse track singlet U001TU/TY	40%	ADIDAS	\$ 75.00
#5-7	VMHS - Shorts	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS	15%	Champion	Ultrafuse track short U001BU/BY	40%	ADIDAS	\$ 75.00
#5-8	VMHS - Pants	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS	15%	Champion	Ultrafuse Warm-Up pant U701BU/BY	40%	ADIDAS	\$ 65.00
#5-9	VMHS - Shoes	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	35%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS		No Bid		35%	ADIDAS	\$ 110.00
#5-10	VMHS - Socks	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS		No Bid		40%	ADIDAS	6/PK \$40.00
6	Girls Track												
#6-1	MHS - Jersey Singlet	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS	15%	Champion	Ultrafuse Track singlet U001TL	40%	ADIDAS	\$ 75.00



Mission Consolidated Independent School District  
Tabulation Form  
Branding Rights for Mission CISD's Game Day Athletic Uniforms 204-23-0

Selected #		Athletic Supply, Inc. DBA Game One			BSN Sports			It's Greek To Me, Inc			PSG Ventures LLC dba PASADENA SPORTING GOODS		
		Vendor #104430			Vendor #19180			Vendor #3701			Vendor #106655		
		Alicia Woodman			Chris Bloomfield			James L Bohnenblust			Tony Alvarez		
		956-245-0549			800-527-7510 x7324			800-336-4486			956-529-6029		
		<a href="mailto:alicia.woodman@game-one.com">alicia.woodman@game-one.com</a>			<a href="mailto:bsnbid@bsnsports.com">bsnbid@bsnsports.com</a>			<a href="mailto:mhk-gtmbids@hanes.com">mhk-gtmbids@hanes.com</a>			<a href="mailto:talvarez@team-psg.com">talvarez@team-psg.com</a>		
0		0			0			0			0		
#	Items	Discount %	Proposed Brand	Notes	Discount %	Proposed Brand	Notes	Discount %	Proposed Brand	Notes	Discount %	Proposed Brand	Notes
#6-2	MHS - Shorts	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS	15%	Champion	Ultrafuse Track short U001BL	40%	ADIDAS	\$ 75.00
#6-3	MHS - Pants	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS	15%	Champion	Ultrafuse Warm-Up pant U702BL	40%	ADIDAS	\$ 65.00
#6-4	MHS - Shoes	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	35%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS		No Bid		35%	ADIDAS	\$ 110.00
#6-5	MHS -Socks	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS		No Bid		40%	ADIDAS	6/PK \$40.00
#6-6	VMHS - Jersey Singlet	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS	15%	Champion	Ultrafuse Track singlet U001TL	40%	ADIDAS	\$ 75.00
#6-7	VMHS - Shorts	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS	15%	Champion	Ultrafuse Track short U001BL	40%	ADIDAS	\$ 75.00
#6-8	VMHS - Pants	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS	15%	Champion	Ultrafuse Warm-Up pant U702BL	40%	ADIDAS	\$ 65.00
#6-9	VMHS - Shoes	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	35%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS		No Bid		35%	ADIDAS	\$ 110.00
#6-10	VMHS - Socks	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS		No Bid		40%	ADIDAS	6/PK \$40.00
7	Wrestling												
#7-1	MHS - Jersey Singlet and Shorts are one Piece	30%	CLIFF KEEN	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS	15%	Champion	Ultrafuse Wrestling singlet U600TU/TY	30%	ADIDAS	\$ 115.00
#7-2	MHS - Pants	30%	CLIFF KEEN	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS	15%	Champion	Ultrafuse Warm-Up pant U701BU/BY	40%	ADIDAS	\$ 65.00
#7-3	MHS - Shoes	30%	CLIFF KEEN	DISC OFF RETAIL	35%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS		No Bid		20%	ADIDAS	\$ 145.00
#7-4	MHS - Socks	30%	CLIFF KEEN	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS		No Bid		40%	ADIDAS	6/PK \$40.00
#7-5	VMHS - Jersey Singlet and Shorts are one Piece	30%	CLIFF KEEN	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS	15%	Champion	Ultrafuse Wrestling singlet U600TU/TY	30%	ADIDAS	\$ 115.00
#7-6	VMHS - Pants	30%	CLIFF KEEN	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS	15%	Champion	Ultrafuse Warm-Up pant U701BU/BY	40%	ADIDAS	\$ 65.00
#7-7	VMHS - Shoes	30%	CLIFF KEEN	DISC OFF RETAIL	35%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS		No Bid		20%	ADIDAS	\$ 145.00
#7-8	VMHS - Socks	30%	CLIFF KEEN	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS		No Bid		40%	ADIDAS	6/PK \$40.00
8	Boys Basketball												
#8-1	MHS - Jersey Home	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS	15%	Champion	Ultrafuse Home basketball jersey U301TU/TY	40%	ADIDAS	\$ 100.00
#8-2	MHS - Jersey Away	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS	15%	Champion	Ultrafuse Away basektball jersey U300TU/TY	40%	ADIDAS	\$ 100.00
#8-3	MHS - Shorts	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS	15%	Champion	Ultrafuse basketball shorts U300BU/BY	40%	ADIDAS	\$ 100.00
#8-4	MHS _ Shoes	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	35%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS		No Bid		35%	ADIDAS	\$ 120.00
#8-5	MHS - Socks	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS		No Bid		40%	ADIDAS	6/PK \$40.00
#8-6	VMHS - Jersey Home	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS	15%	Champion	Ultrafuse Home basketball jersey U301TU/TY	40%	ADIDAS	\$ 100.00
#8-7	VMHS - Jersey Away	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS	15%	Champion	Ultrafuse Away basektball jersey U300TU/TY	40%	ADIDAS	\$ 100.00
#8-8	VMHS - Shorts	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS	15%	Champion	Ultrafuse basketball shorts U300BU/BY	40%	ADIDAS	\$ 100.00
#8-9	VMHS - Shoes	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	35%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS		No Bid		35%	ADIDAS	\$ 120.00
#8-10	VMHS - Socks	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS		No Bid		40%	ADIDAS	6/PK \$40.00
9	Girls Basketball												
#9-1	MHS - Jersey Home	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS	15%	Champion	Ultrafuse Home basketball jersey U300TL	40%	ADIDAS	\$ 100.00
#9-2	MHS - Jersey Away	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS	15%	Champion	Ultrafuse Away basketball jersey U301TL	40%	ADIDAS	\$ 100.00
#9-3	MHS - Shorts	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS	15%	Champion	Ultrafuse basketball shorts U300BL	40%	ADIDAS	\$ 100.00
#9-4	MHS - Shoes	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	35%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS		No Bid		35%	ADIDAS	\$ 120.00
#9-5	MHS - Socks	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS		No Bid		40%	ADIDAS	6/PK \$40.00
#9-6	VMHS - Jersey Home	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS	15%	Champion	Ultrafuse Home basketball jersey U300TL	40%	ADIDAS	\$ 100.00
#9-7	VMHS - Jersey Away	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS	15%	Champion	Ultrafuse Away basketball jersey U301TL	40%	ADIDAS	\$ 100.00
#9-8	VMHS - Shorts	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS	15%	Champion	Ultrafuse basketball shorts U300BL	40%	ADIDAS	\$ 100.00
#9-9	VMHS - Shoes	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	35%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS		No Bid		35%	ADIDAS	\$ 120.00
#9-10	VMHS - Socks	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS		No Bid		40%	ADIDAS	6/PK \$40.00
10	Swimming												
#10-1	MHS - Female Suit	20%	SPEEDO	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS		No Bid			No Bid	
#10-2	MHS - Male Suit	20%	SPEEDO	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS		No Bid			No Bid	
#10-3	MHS - Swim Cap	20%	SPEEDO	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS		No Bid			No Bid	
#10-4	MHS - Warm up Set	20%	SPEEDO	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS		No Bid		40%	ADIDAS	\$ 130.00
#10-5	VMHS - Female Suit	20%	SPEEDO	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS		No Bid			No Bid	
#10-6	VMHS - Male Suit	20%	SPEEDO	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS		No Bid			No Bid	
#10-7	VMHS - Swim Cap	20%	SPEEDO	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS		No Bid			No Bid	
#10-8	VMHS - Warm up Set	20%	SPEEDO	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS		No Bid		40%	ADIDAS	\$ 130.00
11	Waterpolo												
#11-1	MHS - Female Suit		No Bid		40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS		No Bid			No Bid	
#11-2	MHS - Male Suit		No Bid		40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS		No Bid			No Bid	
#11-3	MHS - Swim Cap		No Bid		40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS		No Bid			No Bid	
12	Baseball												
#12-1	MHS - Jersey Home	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS	15%	Champion	Ultrafuse full-button baseball jersey U360TU/TY	40%	ADIDAS	\$ 130.00
#12-2	MHS - Jersey Away	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS	15%	Champion	Ultrafuse full-button baseball jersey U360TU/TY	40%	ADIDAS	\$ 130.00
#12-3	MHS - Pants	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS	15%	Champion	Action Pant 5904BU/BY	40%	ADIDAS	\$ 115.00
#12-4	MHS - Shoes	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	35%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS		No Bid		35%	ADIDAS	\$ 100.00
#12-5	MHS - Socks	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS		No Bid		40%	ADIDAS	6/PK \$40.00
#12-6	VMHS - Jersey Home	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS	15%	Champion	Ultrafuse full-button baseball jersey U360TU/TY	40%	ADIDAS	\$ 130.00
#12-7	VMHS - Jersey Away	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS	15%	Champion	Ultrafuse full-button baseball jersey U360TU/TY	40%	ADIDAS	\$ 130.00
#12-8	VMHS - Pants	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS	15%	Champion	Action Pant 5904BU/BY	40%	ADIDAS	\$ 115.00
#12-9	VMHS - Shoes	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	35%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS		No Bid		35%	ADIDAS	\$ 100.00



Mission Consolidated Independent School District  
Tabulation Form  
Branding Rights for Mission CISD's Game Day Athletic Uniforms 204-23-0

Selected #		Athletic Supply, Inc. DBA Game One			BSN Sports			It's Greek To Me, Inc			PSG Ventures LLC dba PASADENA SPORTING GOODS		
		Vendor #104430			Vendor #19180			Vendor #3701			Vendor #106655		
		Alicia Woodman			Chris Bloomfield			James L Bohnenblust			Tony Alvarez		
		956-245-0549			800-527-7510 x7324			800-336-4486			956-529-6029		
		<a href="mailto:alicia.woodman@game-one.com">alicia.woodman@game-one.com</a>			<a href="mailto:bsnbid@bsnsports.com">bsnbid@bsnsports.com</a>			<a href="mailto:mhk-gtmbids@hanes.com">mhk-gtmbids@hanes.com</a>			<a href="mailto:talvarez@team-psg.com">talvarez@team-psg.com</a>		
		0			0			0			0		
#	Items	Discount %	Proposed Brand	Notes	Discount %	Proposed Brand	Notes	Discount %	Proposed Brand	Notes	Discount %	Proposed Brand	Notes
#12-10	VMHS - Socks	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS		No Bid		40%	ADIDAS	6/PK \$40.00
13	Softball												
#13-1	MHS - Jersey Home	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS	15%	Champion	Ultrafuse full-button Short Sleeve softball jersey U340TL/TG	40%	ADIDAS	\$ 130.00
#13-2	MHS - Jersey Away	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS	15%	Champion	Ultrafuse full-button Short Sleeve softball jersey U340TL/TG	40%	ADIDAS	\$ 130.00
#13-3	MHS - Pants	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS	15%	Champion	Action Pant 5904BL/BG	40%	ADIDAS	\$ 115.00
#13-4	MHS - Shoes	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	35%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS		No Bid		35%	ADIDAS	\$ 100.00
#13-5	MHS - Socks	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS		No Bid		40%	ADIDAS	6/PK \$40.00
#13-6	VMHS - Jersey Home	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS	15%	Champion	Ultrafuse full-button Short Sleeve softball jersey U340TL/TG	40%	ADIDAS	\$ 130.00
#13-7	VMHS - Jersey Away	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS	15%	Champion	Ultrafuse full-button Short Sleeve softball jersey U340TL/TG	40%	ADIDAS	\$ 130.00
#13-8	VMHS - Pants	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS	15%	Champion	Action Pant 5904BL/BG	40%	ADIDAS	\$ 115.00
#13-9	VMHS - Shoes	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	35%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS		No Bid		35%	ADIDAS	\$ 100.00
#13-10	VMHS - Socks	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS		No Bid		40%	ADIDAS	6/PK \$40.00
14	Powerlifting												
#14-1	MHS - Male Uniform	30%	CLIFF KEEN	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS		No Bid		40%	ADIDAS	\$ 115.00
#14-2	MHS - Female Uniform	30%	CLIFF KEEN	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS		No Bid		40%	ADIDAS	\$ 115.00
#14-3	MHS - Shoes	30%	CLIFF KEEN	DISC OFF RETAIL	35%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS		No Bid		35%	ADIDAS	\$ 100.00
#14-4	MHS - Socks	30%	CLIFF KEEN	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS		No Bid		40%	ADIDAS	6/PK \$40.00
#14-5	VMHS - Male Uniform	30%	CLIFF KEEN	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS		No Bid		40%	ADIDAS	\$ 115.00
#14-6	VMHS - Female Uniform	30%	CLIFF KEEN	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS		No Bid		40%	ADIDAS	\$ 115.00
#14-7	VMHS - Shoes	30%	CLIFF KEEN	DISC OFF RETAIL	35%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS		No Bid		35%	ADIDAS	\$ 100.00
#14-8	VMHS - Socks	30%	CLIFF KEEN	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS		No Bid		40%	ADIDAS	6/PK \$40.00
15	Boys Soccer												
#15-1	MHS - Jersey Home	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS	15%	Champion	Ultrafuse Soccer Tee U420TU/TY	40%	ADIDAS	\$ 70.00
#15-2	MHS - Jersey Away	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS	15%	Champion	Ultrafuse Soccer Tee U420TU/TY	40%	ADIDAS	\$ 70.00
#15-3	MHS - Shorts	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS	15%	Champion	Ultrafuse 7" training/soccer short U272BU/BY	40%	ADIDAS	\$ 70.00
#15-4	MHS - Shoes	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	35%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS		No Bid		35%	ADIDAS	\$ 130.00
#15-5	MHS - Socks	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS		No Bid		40%	ADIDAS	6/PK \$40.00
#15-6	VMHS - Jersey Home	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS	15%	Champion	Ultrafuse Soccer Tee U420TU/TY	40%	ADIDAS	\$ 70.00
#15-7	VMHS - Jersey Away	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS	15%	Champion	Ultrafuse Soccer Tee U420TU/TY	40%	ADIDAS	\$ 70.00
#15-8	VMHS - Shorts	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS	15%	Champion	Ultrafuse 7" training/soccer short U272BU/BY	40%	ADIDAS	\$ 70.00
#15-9	VMHS - Shoes	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	35%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS		No Bid		35%	ADIDAS	\$ 130.00
#15-10	VMHS - Socks	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS		No Bid		40%	ADIDAS	6/PK \$40.00
16	Girls Soccer												
#16-1	MHS - Jersey Home	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS	15%	Champion	Ultrafuse v-neck short sleeve jersey U382TL	40%	ADIDAS	\$ 70.00
#16-2	MHS - Jersey away	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS	15%	Champion	Ultrafuse v-neck short sleeve jersey U382TL	40%	ADIDAS	\$ 70.00
#16-3	MHS - Shorts	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS	15%	Champion	Ultrafuse 5" soccer short U270BL/BG	40%	ADIDAS	\$ 70.00
#16-4	MHS - Shoes	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	35%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS		No Bid		35%	ADIDAS	\$ 130.00
#16-5	MHS - Socks	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS		No Bid		40%	ADIDAS	6/PK \$40.00
#16-6	VMHS - Jersey Home	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS	51%	Champion	Ultrafuse v-neck short sleeve jersey U382TL	40%	ADIDAS	\$ 70.00
#16-7	VMHS - Jersey Away	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS	15%	Champion	Ultrafuse v-neck short sleeve jersey U382TL	40%	ADIDAS	\$ 70.00
#16-8	VMHS - Shorts	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS	15%	Champion	Ultrafuse 5" soccer short U270BL/BG	40%	ADIDAS	\$ 70.00
#16-9	VMHS - Shoes	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	35%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS		No Bid		35%	ADIDAS	\$ 130.00
#16-10	VMHS - Socks	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS		No Bid		40%	ADIDAS	6/PK \$40.00
17	Tennis												
#17-1	MHS - Jersey	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS		No Bid		40%	ADIDAS	\$ 40.00
#17-2	MHS - Female Skirt	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS		No Bid		40%	ADIDAS	\$ 45.00
#17-3	MHS - Male Shorts	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS		No Bid		40%	ADIDAS	\$ 45.00
#17-4	MHS - Shoes	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	35%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS		No Bid		35%	ADIDAS	\$ 140.00
#17-5	MHS - Socks	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS		No Bid		40%	ADIDAS	6/PK \$40.00
#17-6	VMHS - Jersey	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS		No Bid		40%	ADIDAS	\$ 40.00
#17-7	VMHS - Female Skirt	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS		No Bid		40%	ADIDAS	\$ 45.00
#17-8	VMHS - Male Shorts	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS		No Bid		40%	ADIDAS	\$ 45.00
#17-9	VMHS - Shoes	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	35%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS		No Bid		35%	ADIDAS	\$ 140.00
#17-10	VMHS - Socks	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS		No Bid		40%	ADIDAS	6/PK \$40.00
#17-11	MHS - Female Skirt	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS		No Bid		40%	ADIDAS	\$ 45.00
18	Golf												
#18-1	MHS - Jersey	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS		No Bid		40%	ADIDAS	\$ 65.00
#18-2	MHS - Female Skirt	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS		No Bid		40%	ADIDAS	\$ 45.00
#18-3	MHS - Male Shorts	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS		No Bid		40%	ADIDAS	\$ 45.00
#18-4	MHS - Shoes	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	35%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS		No Bid		35%	ADIDAS	\$ 85.00
#18-5	MHS - Socks	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS		No Bid		40%	ADIDAS	6/PK \$40.00
#18-6	VMHS - Jersey	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS		No Bid		40%	ADIDAS	\$ 65.00
#18-7	VMHS - Female Skirt	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS		No Bid		40%	ADIDAS	\$ 45.00
#18-8	VMHS - Male Shorts	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS		No Bid		40%	ADIDAS	\$ 45.00
#18-9	VMHS - Shoes	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	35%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS		No Bid		35%	ADIDAS	\$ 85.00
#18-10	VMHS - Socks	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS		No Bid		40%	ADIDAS	6/PK \$40.00

Mission Consolidated Independent School District  
Tabulation Form  
Branding Rights for Mission CISD's Game Day Athletic Uniforms 204-23-0

		Athletic Supply, Inc. DBA Game One			BSN Sports			It's Greek To Me, Inc			PSG Ventures LLC dba PASADENA SPORTING GOODS		
		Vendor #104430			Vendor #19180			Vendor #3701			Vendor #106655		
		Alicia Woodman			Chris Bloomfield			James L Bohnenblust			Tony Alvarez		
		956-245-0549			800-527-7510 x7324			800-336-4486			956-529-6029		
		<a href="mailto:alicia.woodman@game-one.com">alicia.woodman@game-one.com</a>			<a href="mailto:bsnbid@bsnsports.com">bsnbid@bsnsports.com</a>			<a href="mailto:mhk-gtmbids@hanes.com">mhk-gtmbids@hanes.com</a>			<a href="mailto:talvarez@team-psg.com">talvarez@team-psg.com</a>		
Selected #		0			0			0			0		
#	Items	Discount %	Proposed Brand	Notes	Discount %	Proposed Brand	Notes	Discount %	Proposed Brand	Notes	Discount %	Proposed Brand	Notes
#18-9	VMHS - Shoes	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	35%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS		No Bid		35%	ADIDAS	\$ 85.00
#18-10	VMHS - Socks	35%	UNDER ARMOUR	DISC OFF RETAIL	40%	UA/NIKE	BOTH BRANDS		No Bid		40%	ADIDAS	6/PK \$40.00

Notes:

BSN - Total incentives year 1 = \$22,000 + 10% back from BSN \$22K for immediate use (must spend within 12 months) 10% is given at the end of the year Per Campus	Note: We will not be evaluating Athletic Supply and It's Greek to Me as they did not provide incentive packages
BSN - Total incentives year 2-5 = \$17,000 + 10% back from BSN \$17K for immediate use (must spend within 12 months) 10% is given at the end of the year Per Campus	
Pasadena from Adidas - \$15,000 at MSRP \$7,500 first semester \$7,500 second semester Pasadena - \$6,000 MSRP \$3,000 first semester \$3,000 second semester Additional Pasadena to Director (Athletic Central Office) - \$6,000 at MSRP \$3,000 first semester \$3,000 second semester Per Campus	

Mission Consolidated Independent School District  
Evaluation Matrix  
Branding Rights for Mission CISD's Game Day Athletic Uniforms #204-23-0

Bid Evaluation Matrix		BSN Sports	PSG Ventures LLC dba Pasadena Sporting Goods
		Nike/ Under Armour	Adidas
Criteria	Weight	\$22,000 beginning + 10% year-end per campus (Targeted Spending - None)	\$15,000 PSG + \$6,000 Adidas (Half in Fall; Half in Spring) per campus \$6,000 Director (Targeted Spending - \$150,000)
<b>Discount of all products (40 points)</b>			
Base Proposal (total of 166 items on bid)	30	30.0	28.0
Best Quality proposal price (football and track uniforms)	10	10.0	10.0
<b>Meet district's needs (55 points)</b>			
Incentives to Both Campuses	8	8	6
Targeted Spending Amount	8	8	1
Brand Variety	8	6	5
Rebate at Year-end	8	8	0
Reliability on Fabric and Material	8	8	8
Reliability on Comfort and Durability	5	5	5
Accurate Color/ Graphics	5	4	5
Professional Quality of Delivery	5	3	5
<b>Past relationship with vendor (5 points)</b>	5	3	5
<b>Total</b>	100	93.0	78.0

BSN Sports					
$\frac{166}{166}$	$\times$	$\frac{\%}{100}$	$=$	$\frac{100\%}{100\%}$	$\frac{100\%}{\%} \times \frac{?}{30} = 30 \text{ points}$

Pasadena Sporting Goods					
$\frac{157}{166}$	$\times$	$\frac{\%}{100}$	$=$	$\frac{94\%}{100\%}$	$\frac{94\%}{\%} \times \frac{?}{30} = 28 \text{ points}$

8/30/2022 9:30 am

**Committee Members:**

Letty Ibarra  
Daniel Longoria  
David Gilpin

**Notes:**

Factors that affect PSG score:

\*Targeted spending amount= \$150,000; BSN= \$0

\*Rebate at year-end= \$0; BSN= 10%