Mission G.1.5.D.

4 1201 Bryce Drive,
.<0" their future g MiSSiOI‘I, TX 78572
) Mission S P: (956) 323-5500

—>

FY2026 Term Contract: | Fire Suppression and Extinguisher Services #143-26-0

1. Patina Fire & Safety

Awarded To:

Term: One Year/Two (One-year) option to renew

Term Period: July 2025 — June 2026




Mission Consolidated Independent School District
Tabulation Form
Fire Suppression and Extinguisher Services 143-26-0

Patina Fire & Safety

Safeguard Fire & Security

Vendor #105246

Vendor #

Alvin Patina Il

Stephanie Mena

956-309-1527

956-618-1478

passrgv@gmail.com

stephanie@teleprocommunications.com

Cost of Inspections $6,240.00 $15,000.00
Est. Quantity

Items Required Unit Price Notes Total Cost Unit Price Notes Total Cost
Annual Fire Extinguisher Maintenance (Inspection) 1500 $3.50 SOFTWARE $5,250.00 $10 Annual $15,000
Automatic Kitchen Fire Suppression Systems Inspection and Maintenance 22 $45 PER SYSTEM $990 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Recharging Extinguisher - 2 1/2 Ib ABC 1 sS4 PER DEVICE S4 $23.20 Annual $23.20
Recharging Extinguisher - 5 Ib ABC 1 S8 PER DEVICE S8 $23.20 Annual $23.20
Recharging Extinguisher - 10 Ib ABC 1 $10 PER DEVICE $10 $33.60 Annual $33.60
Recharging Extinguisher - 20 Ib ABC 1 $4 PER DEVICE $4 $45.60 Annual $45.60
Recharging Extinguisher - 2 1/2 Ib BC 1 S2 PER DEVICE S2 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Recharging Extinguisher - 5 |b BC 1 $2 PER DEVICE $2 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Recharging Extinguisher - 10 b BC 1 S2 PER DEVICE S2 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Recharging Extinguisher - 20 Ib BC 1 $2 PER DEVICE $2 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Recharging Extinguisher - 5 Ib CO2 1 $15 PER DEVICE $15 $100 Annual $100
Recharging Extinguisher - 10 Ib CO2 1 $20 PER DEVICE $20 $135 Annual $135
Recharging Extinguisher - 15 Ib CO2 1 S5 PER DEVICE S5 $150 Annual $150
Recharging Extinguisher - 20 Ib CO2 1 $25 PER DEVICE $25 $165 Annual $165
Recharging Extinguisher - 2.5 |b Halon 1 $10 PER DEVICE $10 $492 Annual $492
Recharging Extinguisher - 5 b Halon 1 $13 PER DEVICE $13 $830 Annual $830
Recharging Extinguisher - 9 |b Halon 1 S5 PER DEVICE S5 $1,375 Annual $1,375
Recharging Extinguisher - 13 Ib Halon 1 S5 PER DEVICE S5 $1,900 Annual $1,900
Recharging Extinguisher - 2.5 gal C / Water Mist 1 S2 PER DEVICE S2 $35 Annual $35
Recharging Extinguisher - 6 Itr C / Water Mist 1 S2 PER DEVICE S2 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Recharging Extinguisher - 2.5 gal K 1 $20 PER DEVICE $20 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Recharging Extinguisher - 6 Itr K 1 $70 PER DEVICE $70 No Bid No Bid No Bid
6 yr Maintenance on Extinguisher - 2 1/2 Ib ABC / BC 1 S5 PER DEVICE S5 S48 Annual S48
6 yr Maintenance on Extinguisher - 5 |b ABC / BC 1 $15 PER DEVICE $15 $56 Annual $56
6 yr Maintenance on Extinguisher - 10 Ib ABC / BC 1 $17 PER DEVICE S17 $56 Annual $56
6 yr Maintenance on Extinguisher - 20 Ib ABC / BC 1 $18 PER DEVICE $18 $56 Annual $56
6 yr Maintenance on Extinguisher - 5 Ib CO2 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
6 yr Maintenance on Extinguisher - 10 |b CO2 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
6 yr Maintenance on Extinguisher - 15 |b CO2 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
6 yr Maintenance on Extinguisher - 20 |b CO2 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
6 yr Maintenance on Extinguisher - 2 1/2 lb Halon 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
6 yr Maintenance on Extinguisher - 5 Ib Halon 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
6 yr Maintenance on Extinguisher - 9 Ib Halon 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid




Mission Consolidated Independent School District
Tabulation Form
Fire Suppression and Extinguisher Services 143-26-0

6 yr Maintenance on Extinguisher - 13 |b Halon 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Extinguisher Hydrostatic Testing - Dry Chemicals 1 $15 PER DEVICE $15 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Extinguisher Hydrostatic Testing - Wet Chemicals 1 $9 PER DEVICE S9 No Bid No Bid No Bid
New Extinguisher - 2 1/2 Ib ABC / BC 1 S47 PER DEVICE S47 $65 Annual S65
New Extinguisher - 5 Ib ABC / BC 1 S67 PER DEVICE S67 $95 Annual $95
New Extinguisher - 10 Ib ABC / BC 1 $90 PER DEVICE $90 $108 Annual $108
New Extinguisher - 20 Ib ABC / BC 1 $125 PER DEVICE $125 $208 Annual $208
New Extinguisher - 5 Ib CO2 1 $215 PER DEVICE $215 $190 Annual 190
New Extinguisher - 10 |b CO2 1 $250 PER DEVICE $250 $290 Annual $290
New Extinguisher - 15 |b CO2 1 $289 PER DEVICE $289 $370 Annual $370
New Extinguisher - 20 |b CO2 1 $349 PER DEVICE $349 $460 Annual $460
New Extinguisher - 2.5 |b Halon 1 $140 PER DEVICE $140 No Bid No Bid No Bid
New Extinguisher - 5 Ib Halon 1 $404 PER DEVICE $404 No Bid No Bid No Bid
New Extinguisher - 10 |b Halon 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
New Extinguisher - 15 |b Halon 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
New Extinguisher - 20 |b Halon 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
New Extinguisher - 2.5 |b gal C / Water Mist 1 $199 PER DEVICE $199 $285 Annual $285
New Extinguisher - 6 Itr C / Water Mist 1 $210 PER DEVICE $210 No Bid No Bid No Bid
New Extinguisher - 2.5 gal K 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
New Extinguisher - 6 Itr K 1 $287 PER DEVICE $287 $300 Annual $300
Replacement Part - O-Ring 1 S0 PER DEVICE SO No Bid No Bid No Bid
Replacement Part - Nozzle 1 S1 PER DEVICE s1 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Replacement Part - Pull Pin 1 S1 PER DEVICE s1 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Replacement Part - Wall Hook Mount 1 S0 PER DEVICE SO No Bid No Bid No Bid
Replacement Part - Valve Spring 1 S0 PER DEVICE SO No Bid No Bid No Bid
Replacement Part - Trigger Spring 1 S0 PER DEVICE SO No Bid No Bid No Bid
Replacement Part - Pressure Gauge 1 $1.50 PER DEVICE $1.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Replacement Part - Decal 1 S0 PER DEVICE SO S3 Annual S3
Replacement Part - Service Collar 1 S0 PER DEVICE SO No Bid No Bid No Bid
Recharging of Automatic Kitchen Fire Suppression System - up to 3 gal 1 $190 PER GAL $190 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Fire Suppression Replacement Part - Nozzle Caps 1 $2.50 PER DEVICE $2.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Test - Hydro Test 1 $20 PER DEVICE $20 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Repair - Handle 1 S0 PER DEVICE SO No Bid No Bid No Bid
Inspection Slave Tank 1 $10 PER DEVICE $10 No Bid No Bid No Bid
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