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FY2025 Term Contract:

Fire Suppression and Extinguisher Services #143-25-0

Awarded To: 1. Patina Fire & Safety
Term: One Year
Term Period: July 2024 — June 2025




Mission Consolidated Independent School District
Tabulation Form
Fire Suppression and Extinguisher Services 143-25-0

Industrial Fire and Safety Patina Fire & Safety

Vendor #102144 Vendor #105246

Cesar Tovar Alvin Patina Il

956-624-9102 956-309-1527

industrialfireandsafety@yahoo.com passrgv@gmail.com
Total Cost $5,358.95 $3,644.00
Selected # 0 67
Selected ($) 30 $3,644.00
Quantity  Unit Price Total = Unit Price Total
# ltems Required = per Each Notes Cost per Each Notes Cost

#0-1 |Annual Fire Extinguisher Maintenance (Inspection) 1 $3.95 $3.95 $3.50 WITH $3.50

SOFTWARE

Automatic Kitchen Fire Suppression Systems
#0-2 |Inspection and Maintenance 1 S72 S72 S45 PER SYSTEM S45
#0-3 |Recharging Extinguisher -2 1/2 |b. ABC 1 S14 S14 sS4 PER DEVICE S4
#0-4 |Recharging Extinguisher - 5 |b. ABC 1 S14 S14 S8 PER DEVICE S8
#0-5 |Recharging Extinguisher - 10 |b. ABC 1 S20 S20 S10 PER DEVICE S10
#0-6 |Recharging Extinguisher - 20 Ib. ABC 1 S24 S24 S8 PER DEVICE S8
#0-7 |Recharging Extinguisher -2 1/2 |b. BC 1 S6 S6 S2 PER DEVICE S2
#0-8 |Recharging Extinguisher - 5 |b. BC 1 S6 S6 S2 PER DEVICE S2
#0-9 |Recharging Extinguisher - 10 Ib. BC 1 S8 S8 S2 PER DEVICE S2
#0-10 |Recharging Extinguisher - 20 |b. BC 1 S8 S8 S2 PER DEVICE S2
#0-11 |Recharging Extinguisher - 5 Ib. CO2 1 S28 S28 S10 PER DEVICE S10
#0-12 |Recharging Extinguisher - 10 Ib. CO2 1 S32 S32 S11 PER DEVICE S11
#0-13 |Recharging Extinguisher - 15 |b. CO2 1 S32 S32 S12 PER DEVICE S12
#0-14 |Recharging Extinguisher - 20 |b. CO2 1 $38 S38 S13 PER DEVICE $13
#0-15 |Recharging Extinguisher - 2.5 |b. Halon 1 S18 S18 S12 PER DEVICE S12
#0-16 |Recharging Extinguisher - 5 Ib. Halon 1 §28 528 $13 PER DEVICE §13
#0-17 |Recharging Extinguisher - 9 Ib. Halon 1 S32 S32 S14 PER DEVICE S14
#0-18 |Recharging Extinguisher - 13 Ib. Halon 1 S32 S32 S15 PER DEVICE S15
#0-19 |Recharging Extinguisher - 2.5-gal C / Water Mist 1 S15 S15 S2 PER DEVICE S2
#0-20 |Recharging Extinguisher - 6 Itr C / Water Mist 1 $15 S15 S2 PER DEVICE S2
#0-21 |Recharging Extinguisher - 2.5-gal K 1 S40 S40 S20 PER DEVICE S20
#0-22 |Recharging Extinguisher - 6 Itr K 1 $80 $80 $70 PER DEVICE $70
#0-23 |6 yr. Maintenance on Extinguisher-2 1/2 Ib. ABC/ BC 1 S10 S10 S5 PER DEVICE S5
#0-24 |6 yr. Maintenance on Extinguisher - 5 |Ib. ABC / BC 1 S16 S16 S15 PER DEVICE S15
#0-25 |6 yr. Maintenance on Extinguisher - 10 Ib. ABC / BC 1 $20 $20 S17 PER DEVICE S17
#0-26 |6 yr. Maintenance on Extinguisher - 20 lIb. ABC / BC 1 $20 $20 $18 PER DEVICE 518
#0-27 |6 yr. Maintenance on Extinguisher - 5 |b. CO2 1 SO SO No Bid

6yr. maintenance does not
apply to CO2 cylinders any size.
CO2 cylinders only require 5yr..

#0-28 |6 yr. Maintenance on Extinguisher - 10 |b. CO2 1 SO Hydrostatic test. SO No Bid

#0-29 |6 yr. Maintenance on Extinguisher - 15 |b. CO2 1 SO SO No Bid

#0-30 |6 yr. Maintenance on Extinguisher - 20 |b. CO2 1 SO SO No Bid

#0-31 |6 yr. Maintenance on Extinguisher - 2 1/2 Ib. Halon 1 518 $18 S14 PER DEVICE $14
#0-32 |6 yr. Maintenance on Extinguisher - 5 |b. Halon 1 $28 $28 S12 PER DEVICE $12
#0-33 |6 yr. Maintenance on Extinguisher - 9 |b. Halon 1 $32 S32 S12 PER DEVICE $12
#0-34 |6 yr. Maintenance on Extinguisher - 13 Ib. Halon 1 $32 S32 S12 PER DEVICE S12
#0-35 |Extinguisher Hydrostatic Testing - Dry Chemicals 1 S22 S22 S15 PER DEVICE S15
#0-36 |Extinguisher Hydrostatic Testing - Wet Chemicals 1 S22 S22 S9 PER DEVICE S9
#0-37 |New Extinguisher-2 1/2 Ib. ABC/ BC 1 S50 S50 S37-547 PER DEVICE S37-547
#0-38 |New Extinguisher - 5 lb. ABC/ BC 1 $65 S65 S$57 567 PER DEVICE $57 567
#0-39 |New Extinguisher - 10 Ib. ABC/ BC 1 $90 S90 $80-590 PER DEVICE $80-590
#0-40 |New Extinguisher - 20 Ib. ABC / BC 1 $165 S$165  $100 5125 PER DEVICE S100 $125
#0-41 |New Extinguisher - 5 |b. CO2 1 $225 $225  $187-5215 PER DEVICE S187-5215
#0-42 |New Extinguisher - 10 |b. CO2 1 $285 $285 $250 PER DEVICE $250
#0-43 |New Extinguisher - 15 |b. CO2 1 $285 $285 $289 PER DEVICE $289
#0-44 |New Extinguisher - 20 Ib. CO2 1 $350 $350 $349 PER DEVICE $349
#0-45 |New Extinguisher - 2.5 |b. Halon 1 $105 $105 $140 PER DEVICE S140
#0-46 |New Extinguisher - 5 |b. Halon 1 $225 $225 $185 PER DEVICE $185
#0-47 |New Extinguisher - 10 Ib. Halon 1 $325 $325 $285 PER DEVICE $285
#0-48 |New Extinguisher - 15 Ib. Halon 1 S365 $365 S300 PER DEVICE S300
#0-49 |New Extinguisher - 20 Ib. Halon 1 $400 $400 $380 PER DEVICE $380
#0-50 |New Extinguisher - 2.5 Ib. gal C / Water Mist 1 $225 $225 $175 PER DEVICE $175




Mission Consolidated Independent School District
Tabulation Form
Fire Suppression and Extinguisher Services 143-25-0

Industrial Fire and Safety Patina Fire & Safety

Vendor #102144 Vendor #105246

Cesar Tovar Alvin Patina Il

956-624-9102 956-309-1527

industrialfireandsafety@yahoo.com passrgv@gmail.com
Total Cost $5,358.95 $3,644.00
Selected # 0 67
Selected ($) SO $3,644.00
Quantity  Unit Price Total = Unit Price Total
# ltems Required per Each Notes Cost per Each Notes Cost
#0-51 |New Extinguisher - 6 Itr C / Water Mist 1 $225 $225 No Bid
#0-52 |New Extinguisher - 2.5-gal K 1 $250 $250 No Bid

#0-53 [New Extinguisher - 6 Itr K 1 $280 $280 $1955275 PER DEVICE $195 5275
#0-54 |Replacement Part - O-Ring 1 S1 S1 SO NO CHARGE SO
#0-55 [Replacement Part - Nozzle 1 S3 S3 S1 PER DEVICE S1
#0-56 [Replacement Part - Pull Pin 1 S1 s1 $0.50 PER DEVICE $0.50
#0-57 [Replacement Part - Wall Hook Mount 1 S4 sS4 SO NO CHARGE SO
#0-58 [Replacement Part - Valve Spring 1 S1 S1 SO NO CHARGE SO
#0-59 [Replacement Part - Trigger Spring 1 S1 S1 SO NO CHARGE SO
#0-60 |Replacement Part - Pressure Gauge 1 S2 S2 $1.50 PER DEVICE $1.50
#0-61 [Replacement Part - Decal 1 S4 S4 SO NO CHARGE SO
#0-62 [Replacement Part - Service Collar 1 SO SO SO NO CHARGE SO
#0-63 |System - up to 3 gal 1 $325 $325 $190 PER DEVICE $190
#0-64 |Fire Suppression Replacement Part - Nozzle Caps 1 S8 plastic rubber caps S8 $2.50 PER DEVICE $2.50
#0-65 |Test - Hydro Test 1 $280 $280 S20 PER TEST S20
#0-66 |Repair - Handle 1 SO SO SO PER DEVICE SO
#0-67 |Inspection Slave Tank 1 S28 S28 S10 PER DEVICE S10




