



Mission C.I.S.D.

1201 Bryce Drive,
Mission, TX 78572
P: (956) 323-5500

FY2025 Term Contract:	Custodial Supplies #131-25-0
Awarded To:	<ol style="list-style-type: none"> 1. <u>CC Distributors Inc</u> <ul style="list-style-type: none"> • 0-6, 0-7, 0-27, 0-38, 0-41, 0-52, 0-53, 0-81 2. <u>Gateway Printing & Office Supply Inc</u> <ul style="list-style-type: none"> • 0-17 3. <u>Gulf Coast Paper Co.</u> <ul style="list-style-type: none"> • 0-1, 0-2, 0-3, 0-4, 0-5, 0-8, 0-9, 0-10, 0-11, 0-12, 0-13, 0-15, 0-16, 0-18, 0-19, 0-22, 0-23, 0-24, 0-25, 0-26, 0-28, 0-29, 0-30, 0-31, 0-32, 0-33, 0-34, 0-35, 0-36, 0-37, 0-39, 0-47, 0-48, 0-49, 0-50, 0-51, 0-54, 0-55, 0-56, 0-57, 0-61, 0-63, 0-76, 0-80, 0-82, 0-83 4. <u>Interboro Packaging</u> <ul style="list-style-type: none"> • 0-67, 0-68, 0-69, 0-70 5. <u>Liberty Data Products dba Liberty Office Products</u> <ul style="list-style-type: none"> • 0-14, 0-20, 0-46, 0-59, 0-60, 0-77, 0-78, 0-79 6. <u>Pyramid Paper Company dba Pyramid School Products</u> <ul style="list-style-type: none"> • 0-40, 0-42, 0-43, 0-44, 0-45, 0-64, 0-65, 0-66, 0-71, 0-72, 0-73, 0-74, 0-75 7. <u>School Health Corporation</u> <ul style="list-style-type: none"> • 0-62
Term:	One Year
Term Period:	January 2025 – December 2025

Mission Consolidated Independent School District
 Tabulation Form
 Custodial Supplies #131-25-0

#	Items	Item#	Description	Unit of Measure	Estimated Quantity Purchased	ARG Reliable			CC Distributors, Inc.			Central Poly-Bag Corp.			Gateway Printing & Office Supply, Inc.				
						Proposed Brand / Model	Price per Unit	Unit of Measure	Proposed Brand / Model	Price per Unit	Unit of Measure	Proposed Brand / Model	Price per Unit	Unit of Measure	Proposed Brand / Model	Price per Unit	Unit of Measure		
						Notes	Notes	Notes	Notes	Notes	Notes								
W-1	Toilet Tissue, Jrt Jr Jumbo	936A02	Kimberly Clark Scott Surpass or District Approved Equal	1000 sheets per roll, 12 rolls per case	2775 cases	Crystalware/RT121000	\$20.74	as specified		No Bid		Resolute #700	\$32.99	Case	Total Price: \$91,547.25		No Bid		
W-2	Roll Towels, Brown Soft Roll	936A03	Kimberly Clark Scott or District Approved Equal	400 Towels per Roll, 12 Rolls per Box	2100 Cases	Crystalware HRTK12350	\$22.27	12/350		\$27.32	ESSTY RK8002	Marcal #P724N; 425/Roll	\$34.99	Case	Total Price: \$73,479.00		No Bid		
W-3	Multifold Towels, 9.4 x 9.25" Brown, Soft	936A04	Kimberly Clark Scott or District Approved Equal	4000 per Case	415 Cases	Crystalware MFW53412	\$20.10	as specified		\$22.74	ESSTY MK520A	Marcal #P200N	\$26.90	Case	Total Price: \$14,163.50	GEN-1508	\$24.75	CASE	GENERAL
W-4	Vacuum bag, disposable, for 14" Versamatic Vacuum code 2003	936C07	Windsor Versamatic or District Approved Equal	Each	50		No Bid			No Bid			No Bid				No Bid		
W-5	Vacuum bag, disposable, for 12" Sensor Vacuum code 5300	936C08	Windsor Sensor or District Approved Equal	Each	530		No Bid			No Bid			No Bid				No Bid		
W-6	Wet Mop Heads, Medium, #20 Blue, Looped and Banded, 20oz	936D02	Wilen A02612 or District Approved Equal	12 per Case	255		No Bid			\$37.86	GOLDEN STAR ASB1MB		No Bid			GIO-MBLBCT	\$129	CASE	Genuine Joe
W-7	Wet Mop Heads, Large, Blue, Looped and Banded, 24oz	936D03	Wilen AD3613 or District Approved Equal	12 per Case	330		No Bid			\$51.86	GOLDEN STAR ASB1LB		No Bid			GIO-LBLBCT	\$169	CASE	Genuine Joe
W-8	Large Finish Mop, Durable, Looped Ended, 11/14" Head Band, 6-PLY, Rayon Blend and Blue "Candy" Cane Striped Yard	936D04	Wilen Fast Track or District Approved Equal	12 per Case	135		No Bid			\$95.86	GOLDEN STAR AST30BWL		No Bid			GIO-LWB1BCT	\$182.49	CASE	Genuine Joe
W-9	Fiberglass Mop Handle, White, 57", Plastic Speed Change, Latch Style Wiring Away Bar w/roller Adjustment Knob, Safety Orange, Fiberglass Shaft won't Split	936D05	White or District Approved Equal	Each	75		No Bid			\$10.60	GOLDEN STAR HWM1516FPORG		No Bid			JMP-94	\$15.79	EACH	Impact
W-10	Wet Mop Bucket, Wringer Combo, 750 Bucket w/6127 Sidedraw Pressure Combo Pack	936D08	Rubbermaid #7850 or District Approved Equal	Each	50	Lavex274MOPBCKTY E	\$54.21	35 qt bucket		\$56.24	GOLDEN STAR MBU2632		No Bid				No Bid		
W-11	Push Broom Handle, Die-Cast Unbreakable Aluminum Threaded Tip Secured to Natural Lacquered Hardwood Handle, 15/16" Diameter, Overall Length 60"	936D11	Proline or District Approved Equal	12 per Case	10		No Bid			No Bid			No Bid			CW2-24420789	\$5.79	EACH	Coastwide
W-12	Large Plastic Angler Broom, 13" Sweeping Surface, Sturdy Flagged-Tip Plastic Bristles, Angled cut, 32" Long Handle 7/8" Diameter with Plastic Angled Shroud	936D14	UNI or District Approved Equal	12 per Case	140		No Bid			\$71.29	GOLDEN STAR BRA395		No Bid			BWK-932M	\$94	DOZEN	Boardwalk
W-13	Heavy Duty Dust Pan, 2005, Thinner Front Edge, Molded in Serrated Teeth, Charcoal, 12 1/4" Wide	936E01	Rubbermaid or District Approved Equal	Each	10		No Bid			No Bid			No Bid			RCP-2005CHA	\$8.59	EACH	Rubbermaid
W-14	Lobby Pro Upright Dust Pan, Vinyl Coated, Metal Handle, Lightweight Plastic, Black 37" Overall Length, 12.5" Wide	936E02	Rubbermaid or District Approved Equal	Each	60		No Bid			No Bid			No Bid			GIO-85136	\$8.59	EACH	Genuine Joe
W-15	Janitorial Cart, 6173 w/25 Gallon Yellow Vinyl Bag w/Zipper, Non-Marking 8 Rear Wheels, 4" non Marking Front Casters	936F01	Rubbermaid or District Approved Equal	Each	1	Lavex274IC3BKLT	\$184.54			No Bid			No Bid			RCP-617388	\$174	EACH	Rubbermaid
W-16	Yellow Vinyl Janitor Cart Bag, #6183, 25 Gallon Yellow Relacement Bag for 617 Janitor Cart	936F02	Rubbermaid or District Approved Equal (Must Fit Janitor Cart Being Proposed)	2 per Carton	12	Lavex274IC3BAG	\$43.23	fits the cart we are bidding for		No Bid			No Bid				No Bid		
W-17	Scouring Pads, Green, 6" x 9"	936G01	3M or District Approved Equal	20 per Box	90 Boxes		No Bid			\$13.23	3M 96		No Bid			BWK-196	\$6.89	6.89BX/20	Boardwalk
W-18	Doodlebug Pads, 8541, Brown, Scrub N Strip Pad, 4 5/8" x 10"	936G02	3M or District Approved Equal	5 Pads per Box	120 Boxes		No Bid			\$11.11	3M 8541		No Bid			GIO-03125	\$1.41	EACH PAD	Genuine Joe
W-19	Doodlebug Pads, 8440, White, Cleansing Pads, 4 5/8" x 10"	936G03	3M or District Approved Equal	5 Pads per Box	5 Boxes		No Bid			\$11.11	3M 8440		No Bid			MMM-08003	\$50.53	BX/5 PADS	MMM
W-20	Cleaning Pads, Threaded Socket Accepts Any Standard Threaded Handle	936G04	Premier or District Approved Equal	Each	60		No Bid			No Bid			No Bid			GIO-27000	\$3.99	EACH	Genuine Joe
W-21	Wall Washing Pads, Refill	936G06	Wilen Universal or District Approved Equal	12 per Case	5		No Bid			No Bid			No Bid				No Bid		
W-22	Blue Scrub Pads 20" x 1" Thick, for Floor Swing Machine	936H02	Glit Microtron or District Approved Equal	5 per Box	15 Boxes		No Bid			\$30.18	NORTON 14194		No Bid			BWK-4020BLU	\$22.79	BX/5 PADS	Boardwalk
W-23	Natural Hog Hair Pads, 20" x 1" Thick, for Floor Burnishers	936H03	Glit Microtron or District Approved Equal	5 per Box	25 Boxes		No Bid			\$20.46	NORTON 7795		No Bid			BWK-4020NHE	\$24.89	BX/5 PADS	Boardwalk
W-24	Tan/Beige Polish Pads 20" Buffing Pads, 1" Thick, for Floor Burnishers	936H04	3MM #4200 or District Approved Equal	5 per Box	30 Boxes		No Bid			\$18.67	NORTON 54212		No Bid			BWK-4020ULT	\$19	BX/5 PADS	Boardwalk
W-25	Red Buffing Pads, 20" x 1" thick, for Floor Burnishers	936H05	Glit Microtron or District Approved Equal	5 per Box	5 Boxes		No Bid			\$19.20	NORTON 54279		No Bid			BWK-4020RED	\$22.50	BX/5 PADS	Boardwalk
W-26	Black Stripping Pads, 20" x 1" Thick, for Floor Swing Machine	936H07	3M 7500 or District Approved Equal	5 per Box	95 Boxes		No Bid			\$18.88	NORTON 54230		No Bid			BWK-4020BLA	\$22.50	BX/5 PADS	Boardwalk
W-27	Urinal Screens, NABC's Fresh Scent Fragrance, Non-PARA, Universal Size	936I02	Spartan or District Approved Equal	12 per Box	10 Boxes		No Bid			\$12.33	HOSPECO 3901		No Bid			BWK-GEMMAN	\$23	BX/12	Boardwalk
W-28	Liquid Spill Absorbent, Sanitary Disposable of Vomit, Blood, Urine, and other Liquids, Granular Absorbent, Quat/Micro Biocide, Lemon Fragrance, 16oz	936I03	Big D 166 or District Approved Equal	6 Cans per Case	60 Cases		No Bid			\$65.15	BIG D 166		No Bid			BGD-166	\$65	CT/6	BIG D
W-29	Liquid Deodorizer, Tropical Scent, Water Based, Odor Eliminator Combats Malodors, 32oz Container	936I04	Spartan #3068-03 or District Approved Equal	12 per Case	95 Cases		No Bid			\$32	BETCO 23512		No Bid			No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
W-30	Carpet Deodorizer, Mousee Like Foam removes Musty/Stale Odors no Vacuuming Required, Spring Shower Fresh Fragrance, Net 37oz, PH 7.5	936I05	Spartan Contempo or District Approved Equal	12 per Case	20 Cases		No Bid			No Bid			No Bid			RAC-0070ECT	\$74	CS/12 x 21.92 oz	lysol / Resolve
W-31	Apple Cider Deodorizer, Concentrate Liquid Deodorant All Purpose Odor Suppressant, Fights Malodor, Leaves Long Lasting Scent, for Carpets, Floors and Garbage Compactors, 32oz	936I06	Genuine Joe 10356 or District Approved Equal	12 per Case	15 Cases		No Bid			No Bid			No Bid				No Bid		
W-32	Eco Eip 2.0 Freshner	936I07	Fabulous EBC-F-01210782M-11 or District Approved Equal	48 Cans per Case	15 Cases		No Bid			No Bid			No Bid				No Bid		
W-33	JRT Jr Jumbo Tissue Dispenser, 9646 Insight, Smoked Grey	936K01	Kimberly Clark Insight or District Approved Equal	Each	30	Lavex274ITDISP	\$0	free with award of tissue		No Bid			No Bid				No Bid		
W-34	Jumbo Roll Towel Dispenser, 9736, Smoke, See Thru Roll Towels Dispenser, High Capacity	936K02	Kimberly Clark Insight or District Approved Equal	Each	30	Lavex274ITDISP	\$0	free with award of Towel		No Bid			No Bid			KCC-09746	\$65	EACH	KCC
W-35	Universal Folded Towel Dispenser, See Thru Roll Towels Dispenser, High Capacity	936K05	Kimberly Clark or District Approved Equal	Each	40	San Jamar T1755TBK	\$0	free with award of Towel		No Bid			No Bid				No Bid		
W-36	800ML Soap Dispenser, Grey, See thru, 800ML Cartridge Soap	936K10	Kimberly Clark or District Approved Equal	Each	25		No Bid			\$8.69	KUTOL 99512PL		No Bid				No Bid		
W-37	Hand Sanitizer Dispenser	936K11	GEN SAN109 or District Approved Equal	Each	25		No Bid			No Bid	No Bid		No Bid			SAN-1L05A	\$2.79	EACH	DEB
W-38	Foam Carpet Stain Remover, Quickly, Effectively, Removes Oil and Water Based Stains, PH 8.5 Net 17oz	936L01	Spartan or District Approved Equal	12 per Case	10 Cases		No Bid			\$33.35	QUEST 246 GONE		No Bid			RAC-0070ECT	\$74	CS/12 x 21.92 oz	lysol / Resolve
W-39	General Purpose Spotter Water Based Low Residue Formula, Will Not Re-Soil Your Carpets, Safe on All Carpet Including Wool, 32oz	936L02	Johnson Wax #04192 or District Approved Equal	6 per Case	20 Cases		No Bid			\$39.21	BETCO 4251200		No Bid			RCM-11849314	\$4.99	EACH	PROXI SPRAY
W-40	Stainless Steel Polish, Removes Grease, Spills, Fingerprints from Stainless Steel, Chrome and other Hard Surfaces, Water based, Leaves no Greasy Film, Net 18oz PH 8.8	936L04	Spartan or District Approved Equal	12 per Case	10 Cases		No Bid			\$55.62	BETCO 652300		No Bid			WMN-49CT	\$42	CS/6 x 17oz	Weiman
W-41	Breakdown Active Bacteria and Odor Eliminator Live Bacteria, Biologically Destroys Odors, Removes Organic Odors from Carpets, textiles and Washable Fabrics, PH 8.4	936L05	Quest or District Approved Equal	12 per Case	75 Cases		No Bid			\$37.64	QUEST 229 BREAKDOWN		No Bid			RCM-11899915CT	\$85	12/32 OZ	RMC

Mission Consolidated Independent School District
 Tabulation Form
 Custodial Supplies #131-25-0

#	Items	Item#	Description	Unit of Measure	Estimated Quantity Purchased	Gulf Coast Paper Co.				Interboro Packaging				Liberty Gate Products dba Liberty Office Products				Pacific Star Corporation			
						Proposed Brand / Model	Price per Unit	Unit of Measure	Notes	Proposed Brand / Model	Price per Unit	Unit of Measure	Notes	Proposed Brand / Model	Price per Unit	Unit of Measure	Notes	Proposed Brand / Model	Price per Unit	Unit of Measure	Notes
						Vendor # 107538 Gary Ellis 956-739-6846 gpc@gulfcoastpaper.com				Vendor # 11564 Abraham Jeremiah 845-782-6800 abraham@interboropackaging.com				Vendor # 115742 Lee Smith 800-460-8900 lsmith@libertyoffice.com				Vendor # Angelica Delgado 713-527-0889 customers@pacificstar.com			
#0-1	Toilet Tissue, Jrt Jr Jumbo	936A02	Kimberly Clark Scott Surpass or District Approved Equal	1000 sheets per roll, 12 rolls per case	2775 cases	VBRT2100	\$28.56	12/1000'	solid by case	No Bid				Kimberly Clark #04007	\$66.94	36 rolls per case	You would only need 925 cases to be equivalent	No Bid			
#0-2	Roll Towels, Brown Soft Roll	936A03	Kimberly Clark Scott or District Approved Equal	400 Towels per Roll, 12 Rolls per Box	2100 Cases	VBRT350K	\$23.70	12/350'	solid by case	No Bid				TORR #TRKRK350A	\$38.54	12 rolls per case	NA	No Bid			
#0-3	Multifold Towels, 9.4 x 9.25" Brown, Soft	936A04	Kimberly Clark Scott or District Approved Equal	4000 per Case	415 Cases	VBMP91X	\$18	4000/cs	Vic Ray	No Bid				GENUINE JOE #G1021540	\$21.33	16 PFS OF 250 PER CASE	NA	No Bid			
#0-4	Vacuum bag, disposable, for 14" Versamatic Vacuum code 2003	936C07	Windsor Versamatic or District Approved Equal	Each	50	Green Klean VVBGK	\$10	10 pack	solid as pack	No Bid								GREEN KLEAN GK-2003-P	\$2.48	Each	must order in multiples of 10
#0-5	Vacuum bag, disposable, for 12" Sensor Vacuum code 5300	936C08	Windsor Sensor or District Approved Equal	Each	530	Green Klean SVB	\$12	10 pack	solid as pack	No Bid								GREEN KLEAN GK-3300-P	\$2.94	Each	must order in multiples of 10
#0-6	Wet Mop Heads, Medium, #20 Blue, Looped and Banded, 20oz	936D02	Wilen AD2612 or District Approved Equal	12 per Case	255	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid				ABCO #BLM-303WB20	\$19.51	12 PER CASE	NA	Rubbermaid# GF51700BLD	\$129.37	12/pk	
#0-7	Wet Mop Heads, Large, Blue, Looped and Banded, 24oz	936D03	Wilen AD2613 or District Approved Equal	12 per Case	330	Janico 3041	\$54	12 cs	solid by case \$4.50 each	No Bid				ABCO #BCM-21024B	\$45.23	12 PER CASE	NA	Rubbermaid# GF51800BLD	\$140.83	12/pk	
#0-8	Large Finish Mop, Durable, Looped Endred, 11/24" Head Band, 6-PLY, Rayon Blend and Blue "Candy" Cane Striped Vard	936D04	Wilen Fast Track or District Approved Equal	12 per Case	135	Janico 3617	\$84	12 cs	solid by case \$7.00 each	No Bid				ABCO #LM-203CLN32	\$25.95	12 PER CASE	NA	No Bid			
#0-9	Fiberglass Mop Handle, White, 37", Plastic Speed Change, Latch Style Wiring Away Bar w/roller Adjustment Knob, Safety Orange, Fiberglass Shaft w/split	936D05	White or District Approved Equal	Each	75	Janico 3201	\$105.60	12 cs	solid by case \$8.80 each	No Bid				Performance Plus #P16070	\$9.60	PER EACH	NA	Impact# IMP 84	\$24.56	Each	
#0-10	Wet Mop Bucket, Wringer Combo, 7570 Bucket w/5127 Siderward Pressure Combo Pack	936D08	Rubbermaid #7850 or District Approved Equal	Each	50	Rubbermaid 7580	\$79.80	each	solid by each	No Bid				IMPACT #77/2636-3Y-1A	\$67.23	PER EACH	NA	Rubbermaid# G7580BRYEL	\$185.81	Each	
#0-11	Push Broom Handle, Die-Cast Unbreakable Aluminum Threaded Tip Secured to Natural Lacquered Hardwood Handle, 15/16" Diameter, Overall Length 60"	936D11	Prilme or District Approved Equal	12 per Case	10	Janico 4160	\$33.50	each	solid by each	No Bid				GENUINE JOE #G1060468	\$9.65	PER EACH	NA	Boardwalk# BWK136	\$7.41	Each	
#0-12	Large Plastic Angler Broom, 13" Sweeping Surface, Sturdy Flagged Tip Plastic Bristles, Angled cut, 42" Long Handle 7/8" Diameter with Plastic Angled Shroud	936D14	UNI or District Approved Equal	12 per Case	140	Janico 4150	\$8.80	each	solid by each	No Bid				ABCO #BR-1024MH	\$65.08	12 PER CASE	NA	Boardwalk# BWK932ACT	\$149.25	12/pk	
#0-13	Heavy Duty Dust Pan, 2005, Thinner Front Edge, Molded in Serrated Teeth, Charcoal, 12 1/4" Wide	936E01	Rubbermaid or District Approved Equal	Each	10	Rubbermaid 2005	\$2.30	each	solid by each	No Bid				GENUINE JOE #G1021540	\$3.19	PER EACH	NA	Rubbermaid# G2005DCHAB	\$13.02	Each	
#0-14	Lobby Pro Upright Dust Pan, Vinyl Coated, Metal Handle, Lightweight Plastic, Black 37" Overall Length, 12.5" Wide	936E02	Rubbermaid or District Approved Equal	Each	60	Rubbermaid 2531	\$10.85	each	solid by each	No Bid				GENUINE JOE #G1083136	\$7.89	PER EACH	NA	Genunie Joe# RS136	\$12.54	Each	
#0-15	Janitor Cart, 6173 w/25 Gallon Yellow Vinyl Bag w/Zipper, Non-Marking 8 Rear Wheels, 4" non Marking Front Casters	936F01	Rubbermaid or District Approved Equal	Each	1	Rubbermaid 6173	\$145	each	solid as each	No Bid				GENUINE JOE #G1021542	\$194.10	PER EACH	NA	Rubbermaid# G617388BLA	\$317.45	Each	
#0-16	Yellow Vinyl Janitor Cart Bag, #6583, 25 Gallon Yellow Release Bag for 617 Janitor Cart	936F02	Rubbermaid or District Approved Equal (Must Fit Janitor Cart Being Proposed)	2 per Carton	12	Rubbermaid 1966719	\$83.80	each	solid as each	No Bid				RUBBERMAID #RCP1966719	\$73.44	PER EACH	NA	Rubbermaid# 1966719	\$87.71	Each	
#0-17	Scouring Pads, Green, 6" x 9"	936G01	3M or District Approved Equal	20 per Box	90 Boxes	3M-96HP	\$12.26	20 per pack	solid by pack	No Bid				3M #MMMM96CC	\$7.90	10 pk	NA	Boardwalk# 968WK-9P	\$9.26	20/pk	
#0-18	Doodiebug Pads, #541, Brown, Scrub N Strip Pad, 4.5/8" x 10"	936G02	3M or District Approved Equal	5 Pads per Box	120 Boxes	3M-8541	\$10.80	5 per pack	solid by pack	No Bid				3M# 8541	\$26.87	PER BOX OF 20	NA	3M# 8541	\$68.65	20/pk	
#0-19	Doodiebug Pads, #440, White, Cleaning Pads, 4.5/8" x 10"	936G03	3M or District Approved Equal	5 Pads per Box	5 Boxes	3M-8440	\$11.20	5 per pack	solid by pack	No Bid				PERFORMANCE PLUS #P49621	\$26.87	PER CASE OF 20	NA	3M# 8440	\$67.59	20/pk	
#0-20	Utility Swivel Pad Holder, Gray, Plastic Pad Holder, Swivels in all Directions, Base Accepts 4 x 10 Cleaning Pads, Threaded Socket Accepts Any Standard Threaded Handle	936G04	Wilen Universal or District Approved Equal	Each	60	BWK00405	\$9.40	each	solid by each	No Bid				GENUINE JOE #G102700D	\$13.35	PER EACH	NA	Boardwalk# BWK00405	\$87.35	12/pk	
#0-21	Wall Washing Pads, Refill	936H02	Rubbermaid or District Approved Equal	12 per Case	5	No Bid				No Bid				RUBBERMAID #RCP209	\$18.17	PER EACH	NA	No Bid			
#0-22	Blue Scrub Pads 20" x 1" Thick, for Floor Swing Machine	936H02	Gitl Microtron or District Approved Equal	5 per Box	15 Boxes	3M-VB20BCP	\$12.80	5 per case	Sold by case/\$2.56 each	No Bid				PERFORMANCE PLUS #PBL220	\$19.37	PER CASE OF 5	NA	Boardwalk# BWK4020BLU	\$28.05	5/pk	
#0-23	Natural Hog Hair Pads, 20" x 1" Thick, for Floor Burnishers	936H03	Gitl Microtron or District Approved Equal	5 per Box	25 Boxes	3M-VB20T8P	\$12.80	5 per case	Sold by case/\$2.56 each	No Bid				PERFORMANCE PLUS #PBLM20	\$19.37	PER CASE OF 5	NA	Boardwalk# BWK4020HNE	\$28.54	5/pk	
#0-24	Tan/Beige Polish Pads 20" Buffing Pads, 1" Thick, for Floor Burnishers	936H04	3M# #4200 or District Approved Equal	5 per Box	30 Boxes	3M-VB20T8P	\$12.80	5 per case	Sold by case/\$2.56 each	No Bid				PERFORMANCE PLUS #PBL220	\$19.37	PER CASE OF 5	NA	Boardwalk# BWK4020BLU	\$27.75	5/pk	
#0-25	Red Buffing Pads, 20" x 1" thick, for Floor Burnishers	936H05	Gitl Microtron or District Approved Equal	5 per Box	5 Boxes	3M-VB20R8FP	\$12.80	5 per case	Sold by case/\$2.56 each	No Bid				PERFORMANCE PLUS #PBL220	\$19.37	PER CASE OF 5	NA	Boardwalk# BWK4033RED	\$15.92	5/pk	
#0-26	Black Stripping Pads, 20" x 1" Thick, for Swing Machine	936H07	3M #7300 or District Approved Equal	5 per Box	95 Boxes	3M-7300	\$64	5 per case	Sold by case/\$12.80 ea	No Bid				PERFORMANCE PLUS #PBLA20	\$19.37	PER CASE OF 5	NA	Genunie Joe# 931120	\$52.93	5/pk	
#0-27	Urinal Screen, NABC's Fresh Scent Fragrance, Non-PADA, Universal Size	936I02	Spartan or District Approved Equal	12 per Box	10 Boxes	Spartan-8008	\$32	12 per box	solid by box	No Bid				IMPACT #IMP491L0204	\$19.47	PER BOX OF 12	NA	Boardwalk# BWK1001	\$18.22	12/pk	
#0-28	Liquid Spill Absorbent, Sanitary Disposable of Vomil, Blood, Urine, and other Liquids, Granular Absorbent, Quat/Micro Biocide, Lemon Fragrance, 16oz	936I03	Big D 166 or District Approved Equal	6 Cans per Case	60 Cases	Big D-166	\$51	6/16oz per case	solid by case	No Bid				FRESH PRODUCTS #FSC-F-22-BX	\$43.30	PER BOX OF 6	NA	Big D# 016600	\$76.77	6/pk	
#0-29	Liquid Deodorizer, Tropical Scent, Water Based, Odor Eliminator Combats Malodors, 32oz Container	936J04	Spartan #3068-03 or District Approved Equal	12 per Case	95 Cases	Spartan-3068	\$29.40	12/32oz per case	solid by case/\$2.45 each	No Bid				DIVERSIFY, INC #DVO0002938CT	\$36.09	12- 32OZ BOTTLES PER CASE	NA	No Bid			
#0-30	Shower Fresh Fragrance, Net 17oz, PH 7.5	936J05	Spartan Contempo or District Approved Equal	12 per Case	20 Cases	Spartan-6410	\$53.04	12/20oz per case	solid by case/\$4.42 each	No Bid				ITW Pro Brands #ITW10620CT	\$78.53	12 per ct	NA	No Bid			
#0-31	Apple Odor Deodorizer, Concentrate Liquid Deodorant All Purpose Odor Suppressant, Fights Malodor, Leaves Long Lasting Scent, for Carpets, Floors and Garbage Compactors, 32oz	936J06	Genunie Joe 10356 or District Approved Equal	12 per Case	15 Cases	V Bay 00166	\$66.40	12/32oz per case	solid by case/\$4.70 each	No Bid				HOSPECO #08200	\$62.48	4- 16 GALLON JUGS PER CASE	NA	BOARDWALK# 049948	\$86.97	12/pk	
#0-32	Eco Clip 2.0 Freshner	936J07	Spartan or District Approved Equal	48 Cans per Case	15 Cases	Fresh-EBCT72	\$25.56	12/box	solid by dz	No Bid				HEBC-F-11-BX	\$33.83	12 PER BOX	NA	Fresh Products, LLC#	\$82.56	12/pk	
#0-33	JRT Jr Jumbo Tissue Dispenser, 9646 Insight, Smoked Grey	936K01	Kimberly Clark Insight or District Approved Equal	Each	30	VBTD051TB	\$0	each	solid by each, free with order	No Bid				GEORGIA PACIFIC #GFC95009	\$20.10	PER EACH	NA	Kimberly Clark# 09507	\$59.30	Each	
#0-34	Jumbo Roll Towel Dispenser, 9736, Smoke, See Thru Roll Towels Dispenser, High Capacity	936K02	Kimberly Clark Insight or District Approved Equal	Each	30	VBTD051TB	\$0	each	solid by each, free with order	No Bid				KIMBERLY CLARK #KCC09507	\$51.36	PER EACH	NA	Kimberly Clark# 09551	\$60.87	Each	
#0-35	Universal Folded Towel Dispenser, See Thru Roll Towels Dispenser, High Capacity	936K05	Kimberly Clark or District Approved Equal	Each	40	VBTD051TB	\$0	each	solid by each, free with order	No Bid				EMPRESS #EMP1755	\$25.60	PER EACH	NA	Kimberly Clark# 09906	\$54.60	Each	
#0-36	800ML Soap Dispenser, Grey, See Thru, 800ML Cartridge Soap	936L01	Kimberly Clark or District Approved Equal	Each	25	Inspak #BS0800	\$0	each	free with award of 800ml soap	No Bid				SAN JANAR #SANSAN1105	\$37.02	PER EACH	THIS IS A UNIVERSAL DISPENSER THAT WILL FIT ANY SIG.	Kimberly Clark# 92013	\$52.48	Each	
#0-37	Hand Sanitizer Dispenser	936L11	DEB SAN1105 or District Approved Equal	Each	25	Debs-SAN1105	\$0	each	free with award of sanitizer	No Bid				SC JOHNSON #SANSAN1105	\$2.38	PER EACH	NA	SC Johnson# 01010424017091	\$4.84	Each	
#0-38	Foam Carpet Stain Remover, Quickly, Effectively, Removes Oil and Water Based Stains, PH 8.5 Net 17oz	936L01	Spartan or District Approved Equal	12 per Case	10 Cases	Spartan 6374	\$55.80	12/18oz	solid by case	No Bid				CHASE PRODUCTS #43B-5148	\$56.10	PER CASE OF 20- 18OZ BOTTLES	NA	3M# 14003CT	\$179.49	12/pk	
#0-39	General Purpose Spotter Water Based Low Residue Formula, Will Not Re-Soil Your Carpets, Safe on All Carpet Including Wool, 32oz	936L02	Johnson W#04192 or District Approved Equal	6 per Case	20 Cases	Spartan 3035	\$27.60	12/32oz per case	solid by case/\$2.30 each	No Bid				WD-40 COMPANY #WD4003229	\$7.20	PER EACH	NA	WD-40 Company# 309729	\$12.96	Each	
#0-40	Stainless Steel Polish, Removes Grease, Sifts, Fingerprint from Stainless Steel, Chrome and other hard surfaces, Water based, Leaves no Grassy Film, Net 18oz Ph 8.8	936L04	Spartan or District Approved Equal	12 per Case	10 Cases	Spartan 6310	\$58.20	12/16oz	solid by case	No Bid				PERFORMANCE PLUS #PBL1	\$34.01	PER CASE OF 6	NA	No Bid			
#0-41	Breakdown Active Bacteria and Odor Eliminator Live Bacteria, Biologically Destroys Odors, Removes Organic Odors from Carpets, textiles and Washable Fabrics, PH 8.4	936L05	Quest or District Approved Equal	12 per Case	75 Cases	No Bid				No Bid				BETCO #BET1331200	\$5.35	PER EACH	NA	WEIMAN# 49CT	\$57.89	12/pk	

Mission Consolidated Independent School District
 Tabulation Form
 Custodial Supplies #131-25-0

						Gulf Coast Paper Co.				Interboro Packaging				Liberty Date Products & Liberty Office Products				Pacific Star Corporation			
						Vendor # 107538				Vendor # 116742				Vendor # 116742				Vendor #			
						Gary Ellis 956-739-6846 gellis@gulfcoastpaper.com				Abraham Jeremiah 845-782-6800 abraham@interboropackaging.com				Lee Smith 800-460-8900 lsmith@libertyoffice.com				Angelica Delgado 713-527-0889 customers@pacificstar.com			
#	Items	Item#	Description	Unit of Measure	Estimated Quantity	Proposed Brand / Model	Price per Unit	Unit of Measure	Notes	Proposed Brand / Model	Price per Unit	Unit of Measure	Notes	Proposed Brand / Model	Price per Unit	Unit of Measure	Notes	Proposed Brand / Model	Price per Unit	Unit of Measure	Notes
80-42	Disinfectant Deodorant Aerosol, for Air and Surface, Should Not Foam Must Kill a Broad Spectrum of Virus, Including HIV and Bacteria on Contact, 16.5oz	936106	Cello Envelope or District Approved Equal	12 per Case	100 Cases	Spartan 6075	\$48	12/12oz	sold by case	No Bid				BETCO #BET10862300	\$38.49	PER CASE OF 12-- 180Z BOTTLES	NA	CHASE PRODUCTS# 3157	\$72.11	12/pk	
80-43	Chewing Gum Remover, Removes Chewing Gum and Wax, Freezing Action, Colorless, Odorless, 5.3oz	936107	Carroll or District Approved Equal	12 per Case	10 Cases	Spartan 6445	\$61.80	12/12oz	sold by case/55.15 each 12oz	No Bid				CHASE PRODUCTS #438-5165	\$47.06	PER CASE OF 12-- 180Z BOTTLES	NA	IVERSEY# 95628817	\$91.91	12/pk	
80-44	Furniture Polish, Citrosheild, Economical, for Formica, Vinyl, Marble and Wood, Contains Silicones, Net 18oz, PH 8.5, Lemon Scent	936108	Spartan or District Approved Equal	12 per Case	10 Cases	Spartan 6210	\$43.20	12/18oz	sold by case/53.60 each	No Bid				GENUINE JOE #GJ01031JCT	\$49.14	12 PER CASE	NA	Genuine Joe# 10351JCT	\$79.20	12/pk	
80-45	Purpose Cleaner is a Multipurpose cleaner that is Safe and Effective on All Nonporous Surfaces, Ideal for Most General Purpose Cleaning Removes Grease, Works on Oily and Organic Stain smoke film and Heel Marks	936109	Chase #4334102 or District Approved Equal	12 per Case	25 Cases	Spartan 6520	\$45.60	12/18oz	sold by case/53.80 each	No Bid				PERFORMANCE PLUS #PP_28124	\$31.84	PER CASE OF 4-1 GALLON JUGS	NA				
80-46	Treated Dust Cloths, 24 x 24 Yellow Treated Dust Cloths, Disposable	936M01	Chicopee 0416 or District Approved Equal	40 Dust Cloths per Pkg	40 Pkgs	Georgia Pacific 296-24	\$88.96	200/cs	sold by case/5,448 each	No Bid				CHICOPEE INC. #CH00616	\$27.25	5 BAGS PER CARTON	NA	CHICOPEE# 0416	\$109.10	100/pk	
80-47	Wypall Shop Pro Towels, Wipers Absorbs More Oil and Water, No Holes, Strings or Metal Chips, Maintains Strength in Solvents	936M04	Kimberly Clark Shop Pro X80 or District Approved Equal	50 Towels per Pkg	15 Pkg	Wypall 41026	\$33.69	200/cs	sold by case/5.17 each	No Bid				KIMBERLY-CLARK #K41041	\$39.48	PER CASE OF 160 TOWELS	NA	Kimberly Clark# 41029	\$53.86	200/pk	
80-48	Acid Shower Room Cleaner, Ready to Use, Acid Base Formulation, Foaming Ability, Effective Against HIV, MRSA and VRE, Pseudomonellidai, Salmonellacid, Virusid, PH2, Gallon	936N01	Spartan (NAC) or District Approved Equal	4 Gallons per Case	55 Cases	Spartan 3202 Foamy	\$52.60	4 gallon per case	Sold by case/513.15 each	No Bid				BETCO #5480040	\$26.24	PER CASE OF 4-1 GALLON JUGS	NA	Beto Corporation# 4804-00	\$41.44	Each	
80-49	General Purpose Heavy-Duty Cleaner, GP Forward, Contains High Performance Detergents, Can be Used with Scrub and Recast Programs	936N02	Johnson Wax GP 04518 or District Approved Equal	4 Gallons per Case	75 Cases	Diversey GPForward	\$49	4 gallon per case	sold by case/512.25 each	No Bid				BETCO #BET1500400	\$57.09	PER CASE OF 4-1 GALLON JUGS	NA	Beto Corporation# 1500400	\$105.07	4/pk	
80-50	Non-Acid Bathroom Cleaner, NAC Mild, Deodorizes Toilet Bowls, Urinals and Other Hard Non Porous Surfaces, Effective Against HIV, HIV Viruses, MRSA and VRE, PH 6.5	936N03	Spartan (NAC) or District Approved Equal	4 Gallons per Case	15 Cases	Spartan 7496	\$39.40	4 gallon per case	sold by case/59.85 each	No Bid				MIDLAB INC. #03600012	\$35.19	PER CASE OF 12-1QT BOTTLES	NA				
80-51	Power Cleaner / Degreaser, 32oz	936N05	Johnson Wax SpiffFree 3702 or District Approved Equal	12 Bottles per Case	55 Cases	Spartan 2040 Tough Duty	\$33.85	12/32oz per case	sold by case/52.82 each	No Bid				BETCO #BET331836	\$32.89	PER CASE OF 8-32OZ BOTTLES	NA	Beto Corporation# 3731200	\$7.34	Each	
80-52	Scuffit! Remover, Towels, Absorbs and Holds Residue	936N07	Dymon 90130 or District Approved Equal	6 Cans per Case with 30 Towels in Each Can	15 Cases	Scrubs ITW90130CT	\$85.50	180 wipes per case	sold by case/ 5-48 per wipe	No Bid				CHASE PRODUCTS #38-5149	\$32.89	PER CASE OF 12-- 17 5OZ CANS	NA	TW PRO BRANDS# 30130	\$121.06	30/Canister, 6 Canisters/Carton	
80-53	Crowning Powder, Cleanser for Chrome, Porcelain, Ceramic Tile and Other Durable Surfaces, 24/21oz Containers, Silica Based	936N08	Colgate Palmolive Ajax or District Approved Equal	24 per Case	15 Cases	Ajax 12478	\$37.44	24/1oz	sold by case/51.56 each	No Bid				COLGATE PALMOLIVE #12478	\$39.35	PER CASE OF 12-21oz CANS	NA	AJAX# 12478	\$53.38	24/pk	
80-54	Floor Sealer / Finish, 38% Non-Volatile Solids, Resistant to Scuffs, Scratching, Detergents, Water Spotting High Traffic, Durability, Low Odor, Fast Drying and Non-Powdering, UL Listed 5 Gallon Container	936O01	Spartan Shine or District Approved Equal	5 Gallon Containers	140	Spartan 4055 Shine	\$84	5 gallon pail	sold by pail	No Bid				MIDLAB INC.	\$83.27	PER 1-5 GALLON PALE	NA	Beto Corporation#	\$220.69	Each	
80-55	Floor Stripper, High Speed, Quickly Removes Heavy Build Ups and Burnished Floor Finish, Use with Ultra-High Speed Grinders, PH 13.5 5 Gallon Container	936O04	Spartan Emulifier Plus or District Approved Equal	5 Gallon Containers	115	Spartan D084 Emulifier	\$64	5 gallon pail	sold by pail	No Bid				MIDLAB INC. #11080041	\$70.89	PER CASE OF 4-1 GALLON JUGS	NA				
80-56	Floor Finish Restorer, Formulated with Thermoplastic Polymers and Detergents, HP 8.3	936O02	Spartan Buce Back or District Approved Equal	4 Gallons per Case	15 Cases	Spartan D083	\$61.20	4 gallon per case	Sold by case \$13.30 per gallon	No Bid				MIDLAB INC. #113200041	\$74.06	PER CASE OF 4-1 GALLON JUGS	NA				
80-57	Floor Bubble Buster Deframer, Works with Steam-Type Water Washing Carpet Cleaning Machine	936O07	Carroll 70 or District Approved Equal	4 Gallons per Case	35 Boxes	VictRay D00014	\$56	4 gallon per case	sold by case \$9.00 each	No Bid				BETCO #BET4304000	\$75.98	PER CASE OF 4-1 GALLON JUGS	NA				
80-58	Dust Mop Oil, Banana Fragrance, Helps Prolong Life of Floor Finish	936O80	Total Wave 7001 Dust B-Gone or District Approved Equal	4 Gallons per Case	55 Cases		No Bid			No Bid				AMREP INC. #AMR1003411	\$101.52	PER CASE OF 4-1 GALLON JUGS	NA				
80-59	Empty Clear Bottle	936P12		1 Quart Bottles	215	Janico 1132	\$0.70	each	sold by each	No Bid				IMPACT #IMP5032W	\$0.39	PER EACH	NA	IMPACT# 5032W	\$4.85	Each	Must order in multiples of 10
80-60	Triggers, Red/White, Trigger for Bottles, Features 9.5in Tube	936P14	Continental or District Approved Equal	Each	270	Janico 1003RW	\$0.70	each	sold by each	No Bid				IMPACT #9506	\$0.66	PER EACH	NA	Boardwalk# 9506	\$3.78	Each	Must order in multiples of 24
80-61	Antibacterial Hand Soap, Clear, 800ML Pouch for Use w/91180 Soap Dispenser	936Q02	Kimberly Clark Sanifresh 91298-30 or District Approved Equal	800ML Pouch	625	Inopak #BS0800	\$36	12/800ml	sold by case \$3.00 each	No Bid				No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid				
80-62	Disinfecting Wipes 5.5" x 7"	936Q07	Diversey 4599516 or District Approved Equal	160 Wipes per Bottle	570	SCA Everwipe 19280A	\$24.90	6/75 wipes	sold by case/54.15 per 75	No Bid				BETCO #BET3920100	\$39.62	PER CASE OF 4-500COUNT TUBS	NA	Diversey# 4599516	\$10.77	Each	Minimum order 12 Canisters/Carton
80-63	Hand Sanitizer, Foam	936Q04	DEB SAN1LDS or District Approved Equal	6 per Case	45 Cases	Debs-55857	\$42.90	6/1000 ml	sold by case \$7.15 per 1000ml	No Bid				BETCO #BET7952900CT	\$80.70	PER CASE OF 6-33.8OZ BAGS	NA	JC Johnson# 1010424017091	\$37.75	Each	
80-64	Large Latex Gloves, Flock Lined	936R01	Ansell Edmont or District Approved Equal	12 Gloves per Pack	10 Pack		No Bid			No Bid				THE SAFETY ZONE #HGFX-1L-1B-DZ	\$6.74	PER PACK OF 12 GLOVES PAIRS	NA	Ansell Healthcare# 185752	\$28.56	12/pk	
80-65	Medium Latex Gloves, Flock Lined	936R02	Ansell Edmont or District Approved Equal	12 Gloves per Pack	5 Packs	Victoria Bay	\$8.20	12 per pack	sold by pack \$-6.88 each	No Bid				THE SAFETY ZONE #HGFX-1L-1B-DZ	\$6.74	PER PACK OF 12 GLOVES PAIRS	NA	Ansell Healthcare# 185752	\$28.56	12/pk	
80-66	Large Latex Gloves, Flock Lined	936R03	Ansell Edmont or District Approved Equal	12 Gloves per Pack	10 Packs	Victoria Bay	\$8.20	12 per pack	sold by pack \$-6.88 each	No Bid				THE SAFETY ZONE #HGFX-1L-1B-DZ	\$6.74	PER PACK OF 12 GLOVES PAIRS	NA	Ansell Healthcare# 185752	\$28.65	12/pk	
80-67	Small Vinyl Disposable Gloves, Exam Gloves, Powder and Latex Free	936R04	Ansell Edmont or District Approved Equal	100 Gloves per Box	60 Boxes	Victoria Bay PFV5	\$27.50	1000/cs	sold by case \$ 0.275 per glove	Med Pride-Sm-VFFG-E	\$1.84	100/Box	Mfr: Med Pride As per sample #0-67	EMPRESS #EVPP54001	\$24.87	PER CASE OF 10 BOXES OF 100 GLOVES	NA	Ansell Healthcare# DF-350-L	\$16.85	100/pk	
80-68	Medium Vinyl Disposable Gloves, Exam Gloves Powder and Latex Free	936R05	Ansell Edmont or District Approved Equal	100 Gloves per Box	420 Boxes	Victoria Bay PFVM	\$27.50	1000/cs	sold by case \$ 0.275 per glove	med Pride-Med-VFFG-E	\$1.84	100/Box	Mfr: Med Pride As per sample #0-68	EMPRESS #EVPM4002	\$24.87	PER CASE OF 10 BOXES OF 100 GLOVES	NA	Ansell Healthcare# DF-350-M	\$16.85	100/pk	
80-69	Large Vinyl Disposable Gloves, Exam Gloves, Powder and Latex Free	936R06	Ansell Edmont or District Approved Equal	100 Gloves per Box	660 Boxes	Victoria Bay PFVL	\$27.50	1000/cs	sold by case \$ 0.275 per glove	Med Pride-Lrg-VFFG-E	\$1.84	100/Box	Mfr: Med Pride As per sample #0-69	EMPRESS #EVPL4003	\$24.87	PER CASE OF 10 BOXES OF 100 GLOVES	NA	Ansell Healthcare# DF-350-L	\$15.98	100/pk	
80-70	Large Vinyl Disposable Gloves, Exam Gloves, Powder and Latex Free	936R0X	Ansell Edmont or District Approved Equal	100 Gloves per Box	260 Boxes	Victoria Bay PFVXL	\$27.50	1000/cs	sold by case \$ 0.275 per glove	Med Pride-XL-VFFG-E	\$1.84	100/Box	Mfr: Med Pride As per sample #0-70	EMPRESS #EVPLX404	\$24.88	PER CASE OF 10 BOXES OF 100 GLOVES	NA	Ansell Healthcare# DF-350-XL	\$15.98	100/pk	
80-71	Dust Mask Particulate Respirator	936R12	3M Disposable 304120 or District Approved Equal	10- 20 Dust Masks per Box	25 Boxes		No Bid			No Bid				IMPACT PRODUCTS #PGD7312B	\$14.57	PER BOX OF 20 EACH	NA	3M# 7007153492	\$23.51	20/pk	
80-72	Mop Acoustic Bowl	936S02	TOLCO BMOP280100 or District Approved Equal	Each	350	Janico 4100	\$1.10	each	sold by each	No Bid				IMPACT PRODUCTS #IMP209	\$75.98	PER CASE OF 100 EACH	NA	BOARDWALK# 9W003606A	\$2.05	Each	
80-73	Wet Floor Signs English/Spanish 24" Caution Sign, Fold Flat for Easy Storage	936S03	Rubbermaid 6112 or District Approved Equal	Each	35	Rubbermaid 6112	\$10	each	sold by each	No Bid				IMPACT #9152W-EA	\$9.51	PER EACH	NA	Impact# 9152W	\$15.21	Each	
80-74	Short Handle Duster, Poly Wood, Non-Feathered, 25" Long Non-Allergenic Polyester, Electrostatic Action, Washable	936S14	Spartan Blue or District Approved Equal	Each	70	Boardwalk 126	\$6.20	each	sold by each	No Bid				IMPACT #IMP3103	\$7.61	PER EACH	NA	BOARDWALK# 9W9441	\$7.65	Each	
80-75	Long Handle Duster, Poly Wood, Non-Feathered, Extension Handle, Non-Allergenic Polyester Electrostatic Action, Washable, Extends 51" - 82"	936S18	Spartan Blue or District Approved Equal	Each	95	Boardwalk 9442	\$10.20	each	sold by each	No Bid				IMPACT #IMPFLDC	\$14.17	PER EACH	NA	BOARDWALK# 9W9442	\$14.76	Each	
80-76	Replacement 3" Casters, for 26- 35 Quart Mop Bucket	936S09	Rubbermaid 7570 or District Approved Equal (Must Fit in Bucket/Wringer Being Proposed)	Each	10	Rubbermaid #G7570/20000	\$5.80	each	sold by each	No Bid				No Bid				Rubbermaid# G7570/20000	\$8.11	Each	
80-77	Long Handle Scraper, Long Handle Scraper w/4" Blunt Blade, 48" Overall Length	936S14	Unger or District Approved Equal	Each	55	Unger LH12C	\$26	each	sold by each	No Bid				UNGER INDUSTRIAL #UNGHL12C	\$22.92	PER EACH	NA				
80-78	Replacement Blades, 4" Blunt Blades	936S15	Unger or District Approved Equal	10 Blades per Pack	10 Packs	Unger RB10C	\$9.80	10 per pack	sold by pack	No Bid				UNGER INDUSTRIAL #UNGRLB10C	\$9.74	PER PKC OF 10 BLADES	NA	Unger# RB10C	\$14.32	10/pk	
80-79	Replacement Blades, Single Edge, for Handle Safety Scraper	936S16	Unger or District Approved Equal	100 Blades per Pack	25 Packs	Unger SRB30	\$20	100 per pack	sold by pack	No Bid				UNGER INDUSTRIAL #UNGSRB30	\$9.74	PER PACK OF 10 BLADES	NA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
80-80	Safety Scraper, Hand Held, w/1" Single Edge Blade	936S17	Unger or District Approved Equal	Each	185	Unger SR500	\$3	each	sold by each	No Bid				UNGER INDUSTRIAL #UNGSR500	\$3.41	PER EACH	NA	Unger# SR500	\$4.49	Each	
80-81	10 Gallon Trash Liners, Clear, Approximately 24 x 24, 6 Microns, Star Seam	936C03		1000 Bags per Case	70 Cases	Kangaroo R2424N6	\$16	1000 per case	sold by case/5.016 each	INT-1424-L	\$13.62	1000	Mfr: IBS/Pitt/Glopak As per sample #0-81 "Manufactured in Texas"	GENUINE JOE #EJ0LD242408	\$29.39	PER CASE OF 1,000 BAGS	NA				
80-82	20-30 Gallon Trash Liners, White, Approximately 30 x 36, 1.05 mils, Low Density, Star Seam	936C02		200 Bags per Case	3200 Cases	Berry LSR3036X2W	\$21	200 per case	\$.105 each	INT-3036-X-Hvy	\$18.82	200	Mfr: IBS/Pitt/Glopak As per sample #0-82 "Manufactured in Texas"	GENUINE JOE #EJ0D1012	\$33.07	PER CASE OF 250 BAGS	NA				
80-83	55 Gallon Trash Liners, White, Approximately 38 x 58, 1.30 mils, Low Density, Star Seam	936C01		100 Bags per Case	2200 Cases	Berry LSR3858X3W1	\$26	100 per case	\$.26 each	INT-3858-Exh	\$23.82	100	Mfr: IBS/Pitt/Glopak As per sample #0-83 "Manufactured in Texas"	GENUINE JOE #EJ0LD385815	\$33.07	PER CASE OF 100 BAGS	NA				

Mission Consolidated Independent School District
 Tabulation Form
 Custodial Supplies #131-25-0

						Pyramid Paper Company dba Pyramid School Products				Quill Corporation				School Health Corporation				Unipak Corp.				
						Vendor # 60230 Kenny Miller 800-792-2644 x275 kenny@pyramidco.com				Vendor # 62187 Katie Stalkowski 800-634-4809 bid@quill.com				Vendor # 62560 Eric Hoysock 866-323-5465 bid@schoolhealth.com				Vendor # 6206 Brian Marcus 888-898-5120 customerservice@unipakcorp.com				
Selected #						13				0				4				0				
#	Item	Item#	Description	Unit of Measure	Estimated Quantity Purchased	Proposed Brand / Model	Price per Unit	Unit of Measure	Notes	Proposed Brand / Model	Price per Unit	Unit of Measure	Notes	Proposed Brand / Model	Price per Unit	Unit of Measure	Notes	Proposed Brand / Model	Price per Unit	Unit of Measure	Notes	
#0-42	Disinfectant Deodorant Aerosol, for Air and Surface, Should Not Foam Must Kill a Broad Spectrum of Virus, Including HIV and Bacteria on Contact, 16.5oz	936L06	Cello Envelope or District Approved Equal	12 per Case	100 Cases	CHASE 4104	\$29.38	CASE	12 EACH PER CASE - MINIMUM ORDER IS 72 CASES	LYSOL, 777137	\$95.95	12/CS	190Z/CAN		No Bid				No Bid			
#0-43	Chewing Gum Remover, Removes Chewing Gum and Wax, Freezing Action, Colorless, Odorless, 5.3oz	936L07	Carroll or District Approved Equal	12 per Case	10 Cases	CHASE 4107	\$32.53	CASE	12 EACH PER CASE 10 CASE MINIMUM ORDER	MISTY_AMRA18312	\$41.41	12/CS	60Z/CAN		No Bid				No Bid			
#0-44	Furniture Polish, Citrosheild, Economical, for Formica, Vinyl, Marble and Wood, Contains Silicones, Net 18oz, PH 8.5, Lemon Scent	936L08	Spartan or District Approved Equal	12 per Case	10 Cases	CHASE 4109	\$33.49	CASE	12 EACH PER CASE - 10 CASE MINIMUM ORDER	COASTWIDE PROFESSIONAL, 2611680	\$19.89	6/CS	NONE		No Bid				No Bid			
#0-45	All-Purpose Cleaner is a Multipurpose cleaner that is Safe and Effective on All Nonporous Surfaces, Ideal for Most General-Purpose Cleaning Removes Grease, Works on Oily and Organic Stain smoke Film and Heel Marks	936L09	Chase #4234102 or District Approved Equal	12 per Case	25 Cases	CHASE 433-4102	\$30.43	CASE	12 EACH PER CASE - 25 CASE MINIMUM ORDER	DIVERSEY, 2614083	\$38.15	12/CS	NONE		No Bid				No Bid			
#0-46	Treated Dust Cloths, 24 x 24 Yellow Treated Dust Cloths, Disposable	936M03	Chicopee 0416 or District Approved Equal	40 Dust Clothes per Pkg	40 Pkgs		No Bid			BRAWNY, 887669	\$22.18	50/PK	17" X 24"		No Bid				No Bid			
#0-47	Wypall Shop Pro Towels, Wipers Absorbs More Oil and Water, No Holes, Strings or Metal Chips, Maintains Strength in Solvents	936M04	Kimberly Clark Shop Pro 380 or District Approved Equal	50 Towels per Pkg	15 Pkg		No Bid				No Bid				No Bid				No Bid			
#0-48	Acid Shower Room Cleaner, Ready to Use, Acid Base Formulation, Foaming Ability, Effective Against HIV, MRSA and VRE, Pseudomonadical, Virucidal, PH<2, Gallon	936N01	Spartan (Q&A) or District Approved Equal	4 Gallons per Case	55 Cases		No Bid				No Bid				No Bid				No Bid			
#0-49	General-Purpose Heavy-Duty Cleaner, GP Forward, Contains High Performances Detergents, Can be Used with Scrub and Recast Programs	936N02	Johnson Wax GP 04518 or District Approved Equal	4 Gallons per Case	75 Cases		No Bid				No Bid				No Bid				No Bid			
#0-50	Non-Acid Bathroom Cleaner, NABC Mild, Deodorizes Toilet Bowls, Urinals and Other Hard Non Porous Surfaces, Effective Against HIV, HBV viruses, MRSA and VRE, PH 6.5	936N03	Spartan (NABC) or District Approved Equal	4 Gallons per Case	15 Cases		No Bid				No Bid				No Bid				No Bid			
#0-51	Power Cleaner / Degreaser, 32oz	936N05	Johnson Wax Spiffire 3702 or District Approved Equal	12 Bottles per Case	55 Cases		No Bid			DIVERSEY, 1673460WC	\$60.21	12/CS	NONE		No Bid				No Bid			
#0-52	Graffiti Remover, Towels, Absorbs and Holds Residue	936N07	Dymon 90130 or District Approved Equal	6 Cans per Case with 30 Towels in Each Can	15 Cases	DYMON 90130	\$89.98	CASE	6 CANS PER CASE W/30 TOWELS PER CAN - 15 CASE MIN ORDER		No Bid				No Bid				No Bid			
#0-53	Scouring Powder, Cleanser for Chrome, Porcelain, Ceramic Tile and Other Durable Surfaces, 24/21oz Containers, Silica Based	936N08	Colgate Palmolive Ajax or District Approved Equal	24 per Case	15 Cases	AJAX CP14278CT	\$39.98	CASE	24 EACH PER CASE - 15 CASE MINIMUM ORDER		No Bid				No Bid				No Bid			
#0-54	Floor Sealer / Finish, 38% Non-Volatile Solids, Resistant to Scuffs, Scratching, Detergents, Water Spotting High Traffic Durability, Low Odor, Fast Drying and Non-Powdering, UL Listed 5 Gallon Container	936O02	Spartan Ishine or District Approved Equal	5 Gallon Containers	140		No Bid			COASTWIDE PROFESSIONAL, 913187	\$93.06	5 GAL/EACH	NONE		No Bid				No Bid			
#0-55	Floor Stripper, High Speed, Quickly Removes Heavy Build Ups and Burnished Floor Finish, Use with Ultra-High-Speed Programs, PH 13.5 5 Gallon Container	936O04	Spartan Emulsifier Plus or District Approved Equal	5 Gallon Containers	115		No Bid			BETCO, 24419499	\$145.36	5 GAL/EACH	NONE		No Bid				No Bid			
#0-56	Floor Finish Restorer, Formulated with Thermoplastic Polymers and Detergents, HP 8.3	936O02	Spartan Bunce Back or District Approved Equal	4 Gallons per Case	15 Cases		No Bid				No Bid				No Bid				No Bid			
#0-57	Scouring Powder, Cleanser for Chrome, Porcelain, Ceramic Tile and Other Durable Surfaces, 24/21oz Containers, Silica Based	936O07	Carroll 70 or District Approved Equal	4 Gallons per Box	35 Boxes		No Bid				No Bid				No Bid				No Bid			
#0-58	Dust Mop Oil, Banana Fragrance, Helps Prolong Life of Floor Finish	936O80	Tidal Wave 7001 Dust B-Gone or District Approved Equal	4 Gallons per Case	55 Cases		No Bid				No Bid				No Bid				No Bid			
#0-59	Empty Clear Bottle	936P12	-	1 Quart Bottles	215	IMPACT 5032WG	\$0.78	EACH	215 EACH MINIMUM ORDER	IMPACT, UNS32	\$1.28	EACH	NONE	NORTH AMERICAN CORP/#91245	\$0.89	EACH	32 OZ ROUND GRADUATED BOTTLE		No Bid			
#0-60	Triggers, Red/White, Trigger for Bottles, Features 9.5in Tube	936P14	Continental or District Approved Equal	Each	270	IMPACT 50906	\$0.74	EACH	270 EACH MINIMUM ORDER	IMPACT, UNS9229	\$1.31	EACH	NONE	NORTH AMERICAN CORP/#91246	\$1.88	EACH	TRIGGER SPRAYER, VARIOUS COLORS		No Bid			
#0-61	Antibacterial Hand Soap, Clear, 800ML Pouch for Use w/91180 Soap Dispenser	936Q02	Kimberly Clark Sanifresh 91298-30 or District Approved Equal	800ML Pouch	6225		No Bid				No Bid				No Bid				No Bid			
#0-62	Disinfecting Wipes 5.5" x 7"	936Q07	Diversey 4599516 or District Approved Equal	160 Wipes per Bottle	570		No Bid			SANI-CLOTH, 31712	\$7.37	160/CONTAINER	NONE	OXIVR TB WIPES/ #1036210	\$13.52	CAN	160/CAN		No Bid			
#0-63	Hand Sanitizer, Foam	936Q04	Clorox Palmolive or District Approved Equal	6 per Case	45 Cases		No Bid				No Bid				No Bid				No Bid			
#0-64	Xlarge Latex Gloves, Flock Lined	936R01	Ansell Edmont or District Approved Equal	12 Gloves per Pack	10 Packs	SAFETY ZONE GRFY-XL	\$7.20	PKG	12 PER PKG 10 PKG MIN ORDER	AMBITEX, 901137	\$11.03	12/BX	NONE		No Bid				No Bid			
#0-65	Medium Latex Gloves, Flock Lined	936R02	Ansell Edmont or District Approved Equal	12 Gloves per Pack	5 Packs	SAFETY ZONE GRFY-XL	\$7.20	PKG	12 PER PKG 5 PKG MIN ORDER	AMBITEX, 886692	\$9.56	12/BX	NONE		No Bid				No Bid			
#0-66	Large Latex Gloves, Flock Lined	936R03	Ansell Edmont or District Approved Equal	12 Gloves per Pack	10 Packs	SAFETY ZONE GRFY-XL	\$7.20	PKG	12 PER PKG 10 PKG MIN ORDER	AMBITEX, 242L	\$8.61	12/BX	NONE		No Bid				No Bid			
#0-67	Small Vinyl Disposable Gloves, Exam Gloves, Powder and Latex Free	936R04	Ansell Edmont or District Approved Equal	100 Gloves per Box	60 Boxes	HOSPECO VPF232	\$2.99	BOX	100 PER BOX = 60 BOX MIN ORDER	FIFTH PULSE, FMN100041	\$8.75	100/BX	NONE	VANGUARD/ #1040766	\$3.91	BOX	Item #1040766, 100/bx		No Bid			
#0-68	Medium Vinyl Disposable Gloves, Exam Gloves Powder and Latex Free	936R05	Ansell Edmont or District Approved Equal	100 Gloves per Box	420 Boxes	HOSPECO VPF235	\$2.99	BOX	100 PER BOX - 420 BOX MIN ORDER	FIFTH PULSE, FMN100042	\$8.22	100/BX	NONE	VANGUARD/ #1040767	\$3.91	BOX	Item #1040767, 100/bx		No Bid			
#0-69	Large Vinyl Disposable Gloves, Exam Gloves, Powder and Latex Free	936R06	Ansell Edmont or District Approved Equal	100 Gloves per Box	660 Boxes	HOSPECO VPF236	\$2.99	BOX	100 PER BOX - 660 BOX MIN ORDER	FIFTH PULSE, FMN100043	\$7.65	100/BX	NONE	VANGUARD/ #1040768	\$3.91	BOX	Item #1040768, 100/bx		No Bid			
#0-70	Xlarge Vinyl Disposable Gloves, Exam Gloves, Powder and Latex Free	936R6X	Ansell Edmont or District Approved Equal	100 Gloves per Box	260 Boxes	HOSPECO VPF238	\$2.99	BOX	100 PER BOX - 260 BOX MIN ORDER	FIFTH PULSE, FMN100044	\$9.38	100/BX	NONE	VANGUARD/ #1040769	\$3.91	BOX	Item #1040769, 100/bx		No Bid			
#0-71	Dust Mask Particulate Respirator	936R12	3M Disposable 304120 or District Approved Equal	10 - 20 Dust Masks per Box	25 Boxes	IMPACT 7312B	\$11.99	BOX	20 EACH PER BOX - 25 BOX MIN ORDER		No Bid			3M/ #21247	\$23.78	BOX	Item #21247, 20/bx		No Bid			
#0-72	Mop Acoustic Bowl	936S02	TOLCO BMOP280100 or District Approved Equal	Each	350	TOLCO 280100	\$0.92	EACH	NA		No Bid				No Bid				No Bid			
#0-73	Wet Floor Signs English/Spanish 24" Caution Sign, Fold Flat for Easy Storage	936S03	Rubbermaid 6112 or District Approved Equal	Each	35	ABCO W50001	\$6.29	EACH	35 EACH MIN ORDER	RUBBERMAID, 611277PW	\$14.98	EACH	NONE		No Bid				No Bid			
#0-74	Short Handle Duster, Poly Wood, Non-Feathered, 25" Long Non-Allergenic Polyester, Electrostatic Action, Washable	936S07	Spartan Blue or District Approved Equal	Each	70	LAMBSKIN SPEC S24PD	\$2.73	EACH	70 EACH MIN ORDER		No Bid				No Bid				No Bid			
#0-75	Long Handle Duster, Poly Wood, Non-Feathered, Extension Handle, Non-Allergenic Polyester Electrostatic Action, Washable, Extends 51 - 82"	936S08	Spartan Blue or District Approved Equal	Each	95	LAMBSKIN SPEC S8ZEPD	\$5.15	EACH	95 EACH MIN ORDER		No Bid				No Bid				No Bid			
#0-76	Replacement 3" Casters, for 26 - 35 Quart Mop Bucket	936S09	Rubbermaid 7570 or District Approved Equal (Must Fit in Bucket/Wringer Being Proposed)	Each	10		No Bid				No Bid				No Bid				No Bid			
#0-77	Long Handle Scraper, Long Handle Scraper w/4" Blunt Blade, 48" Overall Length	936S14	Unger or District Approved Equal	Each	55	ABCO CT08010	\$6.99	EACH	55 EACH MIN ORDER	UNGER, 812869	\$27.49	EACH	NONE		No Bid				No Bid			
#0-78	Replacement Blades, 4" Blunt Blades	936S15	Unger or District Approved Equal	10 Blades per Pack	10 Packs	BETTER BRUSH 301204	\$4.89	PKG	10 EACH PER PKG - 10 PACK MIN ORDER		No Bid				No Bid				No Bid			
#0-79	Replacement Blades, Single Edge, for Handle Safety Scraper	936S16	Unger or District Approved Equal	100 Blades per Pack	25 Packs	IMPACT 3410B	\$9.25	PKG	100 EACH PER PKG - 25 PKG MIN ORDER		No Bid				No Bid				No Bid			
#0-80	Safety Scraper, Hand Held, w/1" Single Edge Blade	936S17	Unger or District Approved Equal	Each	185	TOLCO 280114	\$1.69	EACH	185 EACH MIN ORDER		No Bid				No Bid				No Bid			
#0-81	10 Gallon Trash Liners, Clear, Approximately 24 x 24, 6 Microns, Star Seam	936C03	-	1000 Bags per Case	70 Cases		No Bid				No Bid				No Bid			UPC242406N	\$9.40	1000 Bags per Case	As per Specification made by Unipak	
#0-82	20-30 Gallon Trash Liners, White, Approximately 30 x 36, 1.05 mils, Low Density, Star Seam	936C02	Tyco Steel Sac or District Approved Equal	200 Bags per Case	3200 Cases		No Bid				No Bid				No Bid			UPC36105	\$16.70	200 bags per Case	As per Specification made by Unipak	
#0-83	55 Gallon Trash Liners, White, Approximately 38 x 58, 1.30 mils, Low Density, Star Seam	936C01	Tyco Steel Sac or District Approved Equal	100 Bags per Case	2200 Cases		No Bid				No Bid				No Bid			UPC5813W	\$20.60	100 bags per case	As per Specification made by Unipak	